
'Sommersby'

satisfies
by Hollywood Rob

Sommersby had a lot go-

ing against it when I walked
into the movie theater.

I had seen the trailers, the
commercials and the stories
in magazines and newspapers .

All of them mentioned it was
yet another American remake

I of a foreign film.

1 Unlike otherAmericanized
versions of french films such
as Three Men and a Baby, this

j one manages to retain a dark
tone that usually gets oblit- -

erated in the translation.
Perhaps this is why I heard
members of the audience
griping as we emerged from
the theater and found myself
wholly satisfied.

The movie does have good
qualities which may divert
some of the bad word ofmouth

r it's bound to get namely
Oscar winnerJodieFoster and
Richard Gere. If this film can
manage to attract some bank
on the basis of these stars,
then maybe stories can bridge
the gap without being steril-

ized in the future. The odds,
however, are against it.

Gere portrays the film's
I title character, Jack Som-- I

mersby, who is returning from
I the Civil War after six years.
x Many had thought him dead
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Jack Sommersby (Richard Gere) and his wife Laurel (Jodie Foster) share a passionate moment after he
returns from a mysterious seven-yea- r absence, in the Warner Bros, romantic drama, Sommersby.

but for the most part the
townspeople are overjoyed to
see him.

Not happy to see him
however is his wife, portrayed
by Foster, and son who has no
memory of his father. Mrs.
Sommersby's new boyfriend
Bill Pullman (Lone Star of
Spacebars) begins to wage a
war for her hand trying to

convince her that the man
who says he's her husband
isn't.

The post-Civ- il War South
depicted here seems authen-
tic enough, but the story puts
Gere in the position of crusad-

ing for civil rights. It doesn't
make sense, seeing as how
the character has no close
black friends going Into the

movie.
On the filmmaking side,

the execution is flawless. From
cinematography to editing it
builds a nice even pace to this
simple story. Danny Elfman's
score is a surprise as it sounds
so little like his previous work.
Of course the actors turn in
solid performances, though
nothing astounding.
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Ratings Scale

The Goods
Smooth and Satisfying

like a 40 of 8 Ball

3
Solid Flick-Cherr- y,

like 1

a 76 Econoline I

Tame
Have a Day

Chessy
Like Fromage

Due to illness,
the part of

Monsieur Lej
Potte will be

LjM played by
7 Monsieur La

Cjpir Trine, who
says the Dim,

she is like
that of sheet


