
IT’S ALL ABOUT THE ES- 
SENCE OF A NUMBIAN SIS- 
TER! I think the recent televised 
ESSENCE AWARDS said it best 
with theirtribute to DA-SISTERS! 
Three SNAPS in a T-MCA 
FORMATION to the folks at 
ESSENCE for honoring THE 
AROUND-THE-WAY' HYPED 
TYPE with all the REAL LA-LA! 

On that same T. I. P., why was 

that Diva wife of that Diva Man, 
who needs a new ego plan, 
chewing on that audience par- 
ticipation gum like it was going to 
run away. I could hear that 
snacking gum screaming from 
my television set, “I CAN’T TAKE 
NO MO!!" 

Something else that seemed 
to hive MO TO HOLD was those 
paring 36 triple D televised black 
CUPS that where UP for the 
televised celebration. Talking 
about a CLIFF-HANGER! 

MR. Q is said to be the re- 

makerof that STAR to be BORN! 
Those who are rumored to play 
the leading roles are those LIPS 
who don’t need to be MO-BET- 
TER, whatever the predicted 
weather, and that singing body 

guard Diva who has been get- 
ting down with MR. DOO-DOO 
BROWN. Well, MRS. DOO- 
DOO BROWN just might want to 
be careful because MR. MO- 
BETTER might just SNAP YOU 
INTO REALTY, and you might 
wake up next to MR. DOO-DOO 
and say, “HAVE I TOTALLY 
LOST MY MIND!" 

That QUEEN OF SOUL is 
said to be MAD at those writing 
journalist for DISSING her ward- 
robe. She is tired of those writ- 
ing folks talking about the gowns 
she wears. WAIT A MINUTE 
SISTER-GIRL-FRIEND!! Don't 
get mad at those journalist, thank 
them, and get a new manager 
and for sure a new stylist. Let's 
just say, “GOD IS TRYING TO 
TELL ME SOMETHING! 

Someone who couldn't get a 

message from GOD even if he 
had a satellite, acted like a 

POPPING COOCHIE at a re- 

cent conference talking about 
the music. Word is that this 
CAMPBELL was all SOUPED- 
UP on himself screaming from 
the black tie award ceremony 

(See Kimberly, Page 21) 

AFRICAN AMERICAN FILMS FEATURED 
MONTHLY ON MOVIE NETWORK (AHN) 

“LADY SINGS THE BLUES” Diana Ross, Billie Dee Williams 

New York, NY—The African 
Heritage Movie Network (AHN), 
celebrates June's "BLACK 
MUSIC MONTH", with the 1972 
classic story of Billie Holiday’s 
life, “LADY SINGS THE BLUES”, 
starring Diana Ross, Billie Dee 
Williams, and Richard Pryor. 

LADY SINGS THE BLUES, 
which will air locally June 12th at 
8:00 p.m., on KRLR TV-21 was 

produced by Berry Gordy, Jr.; 
also jay Weston and James S. 

White. It was directed by Sidney 
J. Furie. The screenplay was 

written by Terence McCloy, Chris 
Clark and Suzanne de Passe; 
from the book Billie Holiday and 
William Duffy. It was released by 
Paramount Pictures in 1972. 

This month’s AHN feature 
offers outstanding musical per- 
formances and hot romance. 

■LADY" is the story of the troub- 
led and glamorous life of inter- 

(See Films, Page 21) 

INTRODUCING 

A Revolutionary 

IDEA IN BANKING: 

LOANS FOR PEOPLE 

WHO ACTUALLY 

NEED THE MONEY. 

Some banks seem to think you need lots and lots of stuff before you can get a loan. Houses. Cars. 

Yachts. It sort of makes you wonder: if someone’s already got all that stuff, what do they need 

a loan for? That’s why we’ve come up with Opportunity Loans. So even if your income’s low, 

chances are fairly high you can get a loan. For things you need. Like a new refrigerator. Some 

reasonably nice new aluminum gutters. Or to pay some reasonably painful dental bills. Any- 

way, it seemed like a pretty decent idea, if we do say so ourselves. 

opramMn Opportunity Loans. Loans for people who actually need the money. 

All loans are subject to approval. Having a good credit history, and/or a history of paying your bills on time will greatly improve your chances of approval. 
Remember, when you’re filling out your loan form, it’s smart to read the fine print. Like this. ©1993 U.S. Bank, Member F.D.I.C. 


