
THE NAACP AND YOU! 

3 »AACf| :*j 

\T~>^ 
Rev. Jesse D. Scott 

President 
Las Vegas, NAACP 

YOUR VOTE IS 
VERY IMPORTANT 

Your vote really does count 
towards making a change 
for the better in our society. 
Voting is a righ that you have 
that is guaranteed by the 
Constitution of the United 
States of America. Voting is 
a process that all of us 
should exercise to select the 
men and women we want to 
represent us in government. 
You should not rest until ev- 

eryone in your family, as well 
as your friends, register and 
vote on election day. 

Ebony Benefits 
the NAACP 

On Sunday, April 3, Ebony 
Fashion Fair will present its 
30th Annual Music and Style 
Extravaganza at the Aladdin 
Hotel. 

A portion of the net pro- 
ceeds will be given as a 

donation to the NAACP to 
underwrite its operational 
costs. 

Tickets are on sale at the 
NAACP for $16 each. 

NAACP 
Membership Contest 
Since 1909 when the 

NAACP was organized and 

had a very few friends to 
turn to, it has been able to 
depend upon the encourage- 
ment and support of the 
Black Church. During the 
Civil Rights Movement of the 
sixties, churches throughout 
America and especially in the 
South gave financial support 
as well as served as meet- 
ing places for the NAACP 
branches. 

Today, as then, we are re- 

questing your continued help 
From time to time, members 
of your congregation and 
your friends come to the 
NAACP for help and no one 
is ever refused. The NAACP 
helps those who are mem- 
bers as well as those who 
are non-members. 

The NAACP needs your 
help in organizing a city- 
wide membership contest. 
There will be established 
three groups of churches and 
organizations according to 
the number of members in 
each church and organiza- 
tion. 

1. Group A churches — 

300 members and above; 2. 
Group B churches — ISO- 
299 members; 3. Group C 
churches — 10-149 mem- 

bers; 4. Group A. organiza- 

tions — 50 members and 
above; 5. Group B organiza- 
tions — 20-49 members; 6. 
GroU|_ C organizations—5-19 
members. 

The church with the high- 
est number of memberships 
in each group will receive an 
award at the NAACP Freedom 
Fund Banquet in the fall of 
1988. The purpose of this 
contest is to get every mem- 
ber of each group to join the 
NAACP. The complaints we 

process every Tuesday night 
at 7:00 p.m. in the Branch 
Office lets us know proof 
positive that racial discrimin- 
ation in Las Vegas in 1988 is 
alive and well. 

We are prayerfully request- 
ing that every pastor and or- 

ganization president who 
reads this article respond to 
it in writing or by telephone 
on or before March 10. 
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sonnel, and couldn’t even 
have integrated lists of 
clients. This would force 
some agencies to choose be- 
tween continuing to serve 

poor clients with counseling 
services or to end their abor- 
tion services. 

Finally, the rule bars fed- 
eral funds to any program 
that “encourages, promotes, 
or advocates abortion.” 

That imposes upon recip- 
ients of federal funds the re- 

quirement that they forego 
their constitutional right to 
free speech. 

The federal courts have al- 
ready ruled such require- 
ments unconstitutional in 
other instances and there’s 
no reason to suppose this 

THE STRUGGLE FOR 
EQUALITY CONTINUES 

attempted end run at the 
Constitution won’t be struck 
down, too. 

The new rules apply to fed- 
eral funds distributed under 
Title X of the Public Health 
Service Act, the basis for 
federal funding of family 
planning services for the 
poor. 

Well over four million 
women a year are served by 
Title X agencies. They get 
services that include testing 
for pregnancy, counseling on 

contraception and family 
planning, and — if they are 

pregnant — information on 
health care services and the 
range of options available to 
them. 

That usually includes a list 
of health providers, including 
abortion,, services. Clients 
can get counseling about 
what an abortion entails and 
whether it is a viable option 
for them. 

Affluent women get advice 
from their own doctors with- 
out hindrance. Poor women 

who go to family planning 
centers aided by federal 
funds, and who don’t have 
other health counseling op- 
tions, would be affected by 
the new rule. 

That’s because the family 
planning agencies aided by 
Title X funds help avert an 
estimated 800,000 unintend- 
ed pregnancies a year. If 
they’re forced out of business 
or have to curtail activities 
because of the new rule, it is 
expected that those pregnan- 
cies will occur, and up to 
half may end through 
abortions. 

Abortion is not the issue in 
this rule—fairness, rights to 
privacy and free speech, and 
medical ethics are the issues. 
Congress and the courts 
should act to overturn the 
new rule. 

Harriet Tubman Day 
Dr. Benjamin L. hooks, 

Executive Director for the Na- 
tional Association for the 
Advancement of Colored Peo- 
ple, will be the featured 
speaker at the 20th Anni- 
versary of the Life Member- 
ship Banquet. Under the 
theme, “The Struggle For 
Equality Continues," he will 
focus on today’s mixed pic- 
ture of black employment. 

To a degree, the black 
middle-class shows signs of 
expansion as more blacks 
gain entry to the workplace 
of white collar corporate 
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America. Blacks als continue 
to make gains in the higher 
reaches of public sector em- 

ployment, and some jobs in 
the skilled trades, from 
which blacks were formally 
barred have, under pres- 
sure, begun to open up. 

The NAACP has made an 

important contribution to the 

expansion of employment op- 
portunities for black Ameri- 
cans. Yet, here as in other 
areas, the illusion of progress 
must not obscure hard un- 

pleasant realities. The prom- 
ise of full employment is still 
an elusive dream for millions 
of poor Americans, a large 
number of whom are black. 

The NAACP recognizes 
that the major causes of un- 

employment among blacks 
are due largely to past and 

present patterns of racial dis- 
crimination; lack of adequate 
education; lack of appropri- 
ate skills; and lack of knowl- 

edge abou the working of the 
labor market and the busi- 
ness world. (Taken from The 
NAACP Long Range Plan: 
The Year 200 & Beyond.) 

Twenty years ago, several 
Branches joined forces in an 

effort to capitalize on the 
varied talents in the Bay 
Area communities. The San 
Francisco Branch, in concert 
with three local branches—El 
Cerrito, Berkeley, and Oak- 
land pays homage to those 
members, individuals and or- 

ganizations, who represent 
the lifeline of this historic or- 

ganization through their 
guaranteed and consistent 

support. One of the main 
benefits of being a member is 
being part of a united effort 
to meet the challenges of 
racism and reinstate our 
communities to their highest 
potential. 

Some of the most impor- 
tant figures in U.S. history 
are common people of un- 
common character who rise 
up to fight for what they 
believe is just. One such per- 
son is Harriet Tubman, who 

escaped from slavery in 
1849 and repeatedly risked 

The Life Membership Ban- 
quet will be held in the Grand 
Ballroom of teh Fairmont 
Hotel, 950 Mason Street, 
San Francisco on Friday, 
March 25, 1988. Reception 
is at 6 p.m. and dinner at 
7:30 p.m. Reserve tickets 
should be obtained no later 
than March 16. 

For further information 
please call the NAACP San 
Francisco Branch at 415- 
922-0605. 

her life to lead over 300 
others to freedom along the 
secret route of the Under- 
ground Railroad. 

Tubman, who was born 
circa 1820, was one of the 
most prominent abolition- 
ists of her day. She also 
served during the U.S. Civil 
War as a nurse, laundress 
and spy for the Federal 
forces. Fellow abolitionist 
John Brown refers to her 
in his letters as “one of the 
best and bravest persons on 
this continent — General 
Tubman as we call her.” 

Following the war, Tub- 
man made her home in 
Auburn, N.Y. The 75th anni- 
versary of her death there is 
marked on March 10, 1988, 
Harriet Tubman Day. 
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