
Goynes gains impressive contribution pot 

Seastrand leads candidates in 

building campaign war chest 

Police seek help in snaring suspects 

A total of $42,690 has 
poured into the campaign 
coffers of Mayor James 
Seastrand this election 
season, putting him in the 
lead for contributions re- 

ceived by candidates for 
North Las Vegas elected 
offices. 

Coming in second in 
contributions, but first in 
expenditures, is Municipal 
Judge Gary Davis, who has 
received $37,752, but has 
spent$45,336. 

Seastrand so far has spent 
$33,832 in his campaign 
against Larry Grubb, a 

perennial candidate who has 
received no contributions 
and has spent $25 — the 
cost of filing for election. 

Between April 13, the end 
of the first reporting period, 
and May 14 the mayor spent 
only $1,112. He collected 
$3,650 during that month, 
including $200 from the 
Silver Nugget, a company 
that had given him $400 
earlier in the year. 

Candidates are required to 
list the names of contributors 
who give them $500 or more. 

Davis’ collection of 

$37,752 and expenditures of 
$45,336 puts him far ahead 
of his only remaining 
opponent, Ray Daines, in 
both categories. Among 
Davis’ contributions during 
the past month have been 
$1,000 contributions from 
both Jackie Gaughan and 
Sahara Datsun. 

So far, Daines, a former 
mayor and judge, has 
received $10,579 in 
contributions. Among the 
contributions during the 
most recent reporting period 
were $1,000 from Jerry’s 
Nugget, $1,000 from 
Christine Powell, $700 from 
his daughter, Martha Daines, 
and $500 from his daughter, 
Marcia Daines. He has spent 
$16,218. 

Sarah Lee Johnson, one of 
the two judicial candidates 
who was knocked out of the 
running in the May primary 
election, listed $1,625 in 
contributions and $3,312 in 
expenditures. The fourth 
candidate for judge,- Larry 
Eckley, received $65 in 
contributions and spent 
$237. 

Among the four candidates 

for two City Council seats 
who made the primary cut, 
Councilman Theron Goynes 
is at the top of the money list 
with $12,383 in 
contributions and $11,247 in 
expenditures. Among his 
contributions during the past 
month was $1,000 from 
Albert King of Inglewood, 
Calif. 

Dale Huntsman, a former 
councilman, is next with 
$7,846 in contributions and 
$8,920 in expenditures. 

Odell Davis reported 
receiving $1,540 in 
contributions and spending 
$2,050. 

Vonne Chowning listed 
$800 in contributions, 
including $500 from the 
Police Officers Association. 
She spent $4,275. 

Among the three council 
candidates knocked out of 
the race, Anthony Gravanti 
was first in the money tally 
with $4,110 in contributions 
and $7,281 in expenditures. 

Helen Pivoda received 
$1,915 in contributions, 
while spending $5,665. 
Margie Farley received no 

contributions, but spent 
$87.93. 

LV Man Arrested In Bar Incident 
A 20-year-old Las Vegas 

man was arrested early last 
Thursday after he allegedly 
robbed a bar and fired a shot 
at the bartender, 
Metropolitan Police said. 

Tyrone Collins, 900 H St., 
was arrested in the bathroom 
at 1101 Cunningham Drive 
by officers who had chased 
him from the corner of H 
Street and Monroe Avenue at 
5:35 a.m., police said. 

Officers were dispatched 
to Loves Cocktail Lounge, 
500 Jackson Ave., after a 

report of a robbery. 
Police said a man 
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reportedly had been fighting 
with the bartender and had 
gone behind the bar and 
pulled out a gun. During a 

struggle, the gun was 

discharged. However, no one 
was hit by the bullet and the 
bartender fled to another 
nearby bar to call police. 

The robber allegedly took 
more than $300 from the bar 
before leaving. 

He was charged with 
robbery, using a deadly 
weapon in the commission of 
a crime, assault with a 

deadly weapon, burglary and 
being an ex-felon in 
possession of a concealed 
firearm. 
Ali says boxing 
ban racially pushed 

Muhammad Ali talked 
about boxing and his seven 

daughters and did a magic 
trick at a Peking news 
conference for Chinese 
reporters. 

He spoke against banning 
boxing, saying there was a 
racist motive in the effort to 
ban the sport. 
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She was in the drive- 
through lane at McDonald’s 
when he approached. An arm 

appeared in the open window 
and the cold steel of his knife 
.touched her throat, leaving 
two small slices. 

She resisted but could not 

Inzie Washington 

keep the young man from 
grabbing her money and 
fleeing into the night. 

A reward of $1,000 is 
being offered for information 
on the April 23 robbery 
outside the restaurant at 
2513 E. Owens Ave. The 
womn described the robber 
as a 5-foot-8, 170-pound 
man in his late teens or early 
20s. 

Inzie Lee Washington, 27, 
is wanted on charges of 

burglary, larceny from a 

person and petty larceny. 
Washington is a 5-foot-7, 
150-pound woman whose 
last known address was in 
the 900 block of Silverman 
Way. 

Secret Witness is offering 
similar rewards for 

information concerning the 
whereabouts of three people 
wanted by police on another 
crime. 
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The North Las Vegas 
Democratic Club 

Endorses and Supports 
the following Democratic Candidates 

Ray Daines 
James Seastrand 
Larry Grubb 
Odell Davis 
Theron Goynes 
Vonne Chowning 

Municipal Judge 
Mayor 
Mayor 

NLV City Council 
NLV City Council 
NLV City Council 

All other candidates are Republican 

Paid Political Advertisement 

Bob Duckett, President 


