
IKIMS STREET AM ME . . bv ru* Jackson 
A few months went & 

gone ME had the 

pleasure of meeting a 

fine-spun lady at the 

grand opening of Heri- 
tage Hall. She gave ME 
her biz’card and ME 
went and hid it from ME/ 

A A A 

self(wow-rudi). How-so- 
ever-be-it, ME found it 
tucked in ME wallet 
where money should 
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have been and that 
made ME feel good and 
ME phoned her and set a 

date for this interview: 
Sandra Scott is a Las 

Vegas person for some 

13 years after her hus- 
band, William Scott, 
retired from the U.S. Air 
Force ... She is a Texas 
Sweetheart in every 
right (Amarillo, Texas). 
She is the mother of Cry- 
stale Batiste and the 
Proud Grand-mother of 
the regal child, Jamar 
Batiste, who left a spark 
of love in the lives of so 

many during his walk 
thru this earth (R.I.P.). 

Sandra has a most 

charming background 
and has set goals and 
worked to complete 
many. At present she is a 

hard working and proud 
Representative of The 

Equitable Life Assur- 
ance Society of The 
United States since 
March, 1984. However, 
she has majored in the 
financial world since 
1967. 

Smiling and sipping 
on a cool glass of ice tea 
she spoke of a main goal 
she is working on, 
namely: To become a 

top flight Agent in her 
biz’ness and to earn the 
respect and rights to 

represent her clients in 
the community and to 
offer them solid help in 
their financial needs for 
days and years to come. 

She spoke of how many 
persons do not plan for 
the future-living, and, to 
set up ways to enjoy 
more than a mere- 

getting along. By way of 
planning a program she 

hopes to guide her 
clients into an assis- 
tance in savings for 
whatever the needs may 
be in life. 

A few personal notes 
on Sandra are: She loves 
to travel and has bon 
voyaged to Holland dur- 

ing the late 60’s and 
again in the 70’s. She 
enjoys dancing and 
wholesome parties for 
relaxation; music and 
singing 

Now let ME tell you 
THE NORTH HIGH- 
LAND BIZ’NESS 
GROUP are really happy 
about the fact TIF- 
FANY’S-12 SOCIAL 
CLUB will honor them at 
LOVE’S COCKTAIL 
LOUNGE on Sept. 29th 
at 9:30 p.m_Donation 
is 13.00 per person and 

there are tickets at all of 
the No. Highland 
Biz’nesses, plus, CHEZ 
POLLEE, PAPA 
SMURFS, BLACK 

DRY GAMES & 
SNACKS .. JUST FOR 
YOU — Beauty Salon 

ELLIOT REALTY ... 
ROBERT NELSON IN- 

PEARL FASHIONS, 
OLLIES BEAUTY 
SALON, MR. KURLS 
BEAUTY SUPPLIES, 
THE SASSY FASHION 
MODELS, & ME! THE 
SASSY FASHION 
MODELS ARE PLAN- 
NING TO PRESENT: A 
SASSY INSIGHT INTO 
FASHIONS AND 
BEAUTY FOR EACH 
AND EVERYONE WHO 
COMES OUT AND EN- 
JOYS A NIGHT OF 
HONOR TO THESE 
PEOPLE WHO HAVE 
PUSHED AHEAD 
AGAINST HARD ODDS 
TO BRING US A NEW 
BREATH OF AIR BY- 
WAY OF IMPROVING 
THE NEEDS OF OUR 
COMMUNITY! HAIR 
UN-LIMITED ELITE 
CLEANERS & LAUN- 

Sandra Scott 

SURANCE... AND THE 
ONE AND ONLY 
BLACK HAIR 2001 
(which was the second 
building erected on the 
sites between Owens 
and Washington, then 
came Just For You, and 
a BIG HATS OFF TO 
BOOKER BURNEY for 
being a #-UNO! a few 
short years ago.) 

ME is happy to be a 

part of this HONORING 
every since ME met 
BOOKER, MACK, JER- 
OME (Black Hair 2001) 
MOSELY when ME used 
to deliver them hot & 
good lunches from Rose 
Burrell — SOUL SIS- 
TERS CAFE. They 
would tip me a few coins 
— REMEMBER BRO- 
THERS!-? 

monamodi/84 


