
This Week's Daytime Programming 
MON THRU FRI 
MORNING 

5‘30 
O SUNRISE SEMESTER 

6:00 

§ VARIOUS PROGRAMMING 
700 CLUB 
LASSIE 

g 
6:30 

VARIOUS PROGRAMMING 
LONE RANGER 

7:00 

t 
TODAY 
NEW ZOO REVUE 
MORNING SHOW 

GOOD MORNING 
ERICA 

7’30 

Nfred flintstone anc 
IENDS 

7:45 
flj) A.M. WEATHER 

8:00 
©RICHARD SIMMONS 
© CAPTAIN KANGAROO 
CD) VARIOUS PROGRAMMING 

8:30 
© PAGE 5 

9:00 
LAS VEGAS GAMBIT 
PHIL DONAHUE SHOW 

□ JEFFERSONS 
g SESAME STREET 

l YOUR NEW DAY 
9:30 

iBLOCKBUSTERS 
I ALICE 
l ALL IN THE FAMILY 

10:00 
WHEELOF FORTUNE 
TONI TENNILLE SHOW 8 

3KSE® 
0 

YOUNG AND THE 
STLESS 

EDUCATIONAL 
OGRAMMING (UNTIL 1:00) 
THE LOVE BOAT 

10:30 
PASSWORD PLUS 

11:00 
ICARDSHARKS 
I JOHN DAVIDSON SHOW 
I HOUR MAGAZINE 
I FAMILY FEUD 

11:30 
iDOCTORS 
l RYAN'S HOPE 

AFTERNOON 

12:00 
Q TODAY AT NOON 
O NEWS 
flD EDUCATIONAL 
PROGRAMMING (UNTIL 1:00) 

©SCO 
0300 
ffi ALL MY CHILDREN 

12:30 
DAYS OF OUR LIVES 

CAROL BURNETT AND 
IENDS 
SEARCH FOR TOMORROW 

1:00 
YOU BET YOUR LIFE 
AS THE WORLD TURNS 
ELECTRIC COMPANY 
ONE LIFE TO LIVE 

1 '30 
©ANOTHER WORLD 
Q MOVIE 'Quarantined' 
(MON.). 'Day The Earth 
Moved' (TUE.). 'Just An Old 
Sweet Song' (WED ). 'Linda' 
(THUR.). 'Nevada Smith' 
(FRI.) 

1:35 
(E 3-2-1 CONTACT @00 

@@000 
@@00 
f3@0 

8 
2:00 

GUIDING LIGHT 
GENERAL HOSPITAL 

2:10 
© VARIOUS PROGRAMMING 

2:30 
TEXAS 

HOCKING 
UEGRASS 

VALLEY 

3:00 
I LOVE LUCY 
ONE DAY AT A TIME 
MISTER ROGERS 
EDGE OF NIGHT 

3'30 
MIKE DOUGLAS SHOW 
CISCO KID 
TO TELL THE TRUTH 
VILLA ALEGRE 
MERV GRIFFIN 

4:00 
GILLIGAN'S ISLAND 
MATCH GAME 
3-2-1 CONTACT 

4:30 
© ROCKFORD FILES 
©SANFORD AND SON 
©JOKER’S WILD 
© ELECTRIC COMPANY 

5:00 
MOVIE (TUE.,WED.,THUR.) 

'Davy Crockett Indian Fighter' 
(TUE.). 'Pete's Dragon' 
(WED.). 'Davy Crockett AtThe 
Alamo' (THUR.) 

SIRHODA K BULLSEYE 
0 SESAME STREET 
D ABC NEWS 

5:30 
MOVIE (FRI.) 'Stories From A 

Flying Trunk' (FRI.) 
© NBC NEWS 
© BOB NEWHARTSHOW 
©CBS NEWS 
©NEWS 

Brian confronts a bomb 
wedged in the wall of a bur- 
ning building, and is 
reprimanded by his senior 
officer for his reckless han- 
dling of the task. (Closed- 
Captioned; U.S.A.) (60 mins.) 
© ISSUES AND ANSWERS 

12:30 
© PROBE 

1:00 

80 TO BE ANNOUNCED 
D ABBOTT AND COSTELLO 

1'30 
o BOB HOPE DESERT 
CLASSIC NBC Sports will 
provide exclusive coverage of 
the final round of this PGA 
tournament from La Quinta 
Country Club in Palm Desert, 
Calif. (2 hrs.) 
©MARY TYLER MOORE 

2:00 
Q TELETHON CONTINUES 
fiy TO BE ANNOUNCED 
© MARCUS WELBY 

2‘30 
EMERALD CUP GYMNASTICS 
'The Making of a Champion' 
Coverage of this elite com- 

petition is featured with a 
behind-the-scenes look at the 
finest American and Canadian 
women gymnasts. 

3:00 
O TRAVEL WITH JEANNE 
©TO BE ANNOUNCED 
© IRONSIDE 

3.3O 
MOVIE -{SCIENCE-FICTION) ** 

"Moonraker" 1979 Roger 
Moore, Lois Chiles. Secret 
Agent 007 follows the trail of 
an evil madman from the 
canals of Venice to Brazilian 
jungles and all the way into 
outer space. (Rated PG) (2 
hrs., 30 mins.) 

8 SIX MILLION DOLLAR MAN 
ON THE RECORD 

4:00 
0 TELETHON CONTINUES 
QMOVIE -{COMEDY) "Vi 
T,Thief Who Came To Dinner" 
1972 Ryan O’Neal, Jacqueline 
Bisset. Share the fun as three 
of today's hottest stars join 
forces in this screwball romp 
about a computer-analyst 
dropout turned burglar, a sexy 
society lady amused by his 
daring, and his ex-wife who 
wants a return engagement. 
(PG) (2 hrs.) 
©TO BE ANNOUNCED 
© PLOT TO MURDER HITLER 

4:30 
0 DICK GREGG'S SPORTS 
SHOW 

5:00 
©MEET THE PRESS 
© SOCCER MADE IN GER- 
MANY 
© ABC NEWS 

5-30 

8 NBC NEWS' 
CLOSE-UP 

EVENING 

6:00 
MOVIE -{WESTERN).Big 
Jake" 1971 John Wayne. 
Richard Boone. A cowboy 
tracks down the gang that has 
kidnapped his grandson. (2 
hrs.) 

NEWS 
rIGHT BACK WITH DAVID 

)ROWITZ 
© FIRING LINE Host: William 
K Buckley, Jr. 
© KUNG-FU 

6:30 
QWILD KINGDOM 

0 INDEPENDENT NETWORK 
NEWS 
O CBS NEWS 

7:00 
0 DISNEY'S WONDERFUL 
WORLD 
£1 MONTE CARLO SHOW 
060 MINUTES 
ffi NEW VOICE 'For Adults 
Only1 Partly as a joke and 
partly as a newspaper 
assignment, Larry and Millie 
take the new high school 
course in adult living. Their 
participation becomes serious 
business when they learn how 
difficult it is for a couple to 
make mutual decisions and 
respect each other's rights 
and feelings. 
£F) CATASTROPHE: NO SAFE 
PLACE Charles Bronson and 
Jill Ireland introduce 
astounding footage and the 
brave survivors of such 
terrifying calamities as the 
sudden end of one of the 
world's most luxurious ocean 
liners, a devastating dam 
break in the middle of Los 
Angeles, a miraculous landing 
at sea by a crippled airliner, 
and the ravaging four-day 
firestorm that left $100 million 
in damage. (60 mins.) 

7*30 
Qp FROM JUMPSTREET 
^Gospel and Spirituals' Host: 
Oscar Brown. Jr. (Closed- 
Captioned; U.S.A.) 

8:00 
MOVIE -(COMEDY) •*% 
"Meatballs" 1979 Bill Murray. 
A summer camp counselor 
pulls off one outrageous gag 
after another. (Rated PG) (90 
mins.) 
0 CHiPs Ponch falls in love 
with a pretty new dispatcher at 
headquarters, but she won't 
reciprocate his feelings 
because she feels respon- 
sible for the death of her 
former fiance. (60 mins.) 
0WESTGATE REPORT 
O ONE DAY AT A TIME 
Schneider gets involved with a 

22-year-old which could prove 
to be more than he can han- 
dle. (60 mins.) 
fTn SHOCK OF THE NEW 
Powers That Be' The political 
implications that occurred in 
World War I brought some 
artists to place the avant- 
garde at the service of real 
political revolutions. Much of 
this episode is devoted to the 
relationship between Russian 
constructivism and the 1917 
revolution. (60 mins.) 
ffi THOSE AMAZING 
ANIMALS 

8:30 
0 RALPH PEARLSHOW 

9:00 
0 THE BIG EVENT Bob Hope 
Anniversary Show' Bob Hope 
will celebrate three decades 
as the star of television 
specials in a gala presentation 
spotlighting a host of show 
business luminaries. (2 hrs.) 
0 KENNETH COPELAND 
0 ALICE 
® MASTERPIECE THEATRE 
Tfanger UXB1 Episode III. 
Brian and his roommate Ken 
return from a bomb disposal 
briefing and are dispatched to 
defuse a booby-trapped bomb 
in a schoolyard. (Closed- 
Captioned: U.S.A.) (60 mins.) 
© SUNDAY NIGHT MOVIE 
The Choirboys' 1978 Stars: 

Charles Durning. Louis 
Gossett. Based on Joseph 
Wambaugh's best-selling 
novel, the story revolves 
around ten street-wise Los 
Angeles cops on night duty. 
They meet for 'choir practice'- 
-wine, women and song-in the 
early morning hours to relax 
from the tensions and horrors 
that threaten to rob them of 
their sanity. (2 hrs.) 

9:30 
MOVIE-(SCIENCE-FICTION) ** 

"Moonraker" 1979 Roger 
Moore, Lois Chiles. Secret 
Agent 007 follows the trail of 
an evil madman from the 
canals of Venice to Brazilian 
jungles and all the way into 
outer space. (Rated PG) (2 
hrs.. 15 mins.) 
Q THE jeffersons 
George's upcoming ap- 
pearance on a local patriotic 
television show is jeopardized 
when it is learned he is 
sponsoring a Cuban im- 
migrant. 

10:00 
Q JIMMY SWAGGART 
fly NOVA 'Message in 
Rocks' NOVA explores 
clues gathered from the an- 
cient rocks and meteorites in 
an'attempt to piece together 
earth's origins. (Closed- 
Captioned: U.S.A.) (60 mins.) 

11:00 

the 
the 

B?c NEWS 
OLID GOLD 

11:15 
OCBS NEWS 

11:30 
Q NBC LATE NIGHT MOVIE A 
triple bill of comedy episodes 
from the series 'Hello Larry' 
starring McLean Stevenson is 
featured. (Repeat; 90 mins.) 
QMOVIE -(CRIME-DRAMA) "Vfe "Stone Killer" 1973 
Charles Bronson, Martin 
Balsam. A tough cop tries to 
unravel a chain of mystery that 
leads to the plan of Vietnam 
vets staging a gangland 
massacre. (2 hrs.) 
© NEWS 

11:45 
MOVIE-(DRAMA)*** "Bridge 
At Remagen" 1969 George 
Segal. Robert Vaughn. Based 
on the factual account of the 
efforts by Allied soldiers to 
commandeer an important 
tactical bridge from German 
hands before it's destroyed, 
and thus secure entry into 
Germany. (2 hrs.) 
©ABC NEWS 

12:00 
QMOVIE -(DRAMA) ** 

"Return to Peyton Place" 
1961 Jeff Chandler, Eleanor 
Parker. The lives of nine 
people are dramatically af- 
fected when a young author 
writes a sensational novel 
about her home town com- 

munity. (90 mins.) 
©DICK MAURICE SHOW 

1:00 
©MOVIE -(WESTERN) *Vfe 
"Bridger" 1975 James 
Wainwright, Dirk Blocker. 
Based on an actual incident in 
the life of the American 
mountain man, Jim Bridger, in 
the year 1830. (2 hrs.) 

i -30 
QMOVIE -(DRAMA) **1/2 
"Wheeler and Murdoch" 
Jack Warden, Christopher 
Stone. A pair of private eyes, 
based in Seattle, Wash., try to 

crack a syndicate murder and 
a million-dollar robbery. (2 
hrs.) 
Q NEWS 

1:45 
BEAUTIFUL, BABY, 

BEAUTIFUL An Insider's 
Look at the Modeling Industry1 
0 SIX MILLION DOLLAR MAN 

2:45 
©NEWS 

3:15 
Q FACE THE MUSIC 

3‘30 
QMOVIE -(WESTERN) *** 

"The Macahans" 1976 James 
Arness, Eva Marie Saint. The 
story of a family who went 
westward to escape having 
their sons serve in the Civil 
War. (90 mins.) 

Monday 
JAN. 19,1981 
EVENING 

6:00 
MOVIE-(CARTOON) *** "Dot 
And The Kangaroo" 
Animated treat about a little 
girl who gets lost in the woods 
and is befriended by a 

kangaroo. (Rated G) (90 mins.) 
00 NEWS 
O HOGAN'S HEROES 
(K DICK CAVETT SHOW 
©WORLD OF PEOPLE 

6:30 
0 HOLLYWOOD SQUARES 
Q INDEPENDENT NETWORK 
NEWS 
0 PM MAGAZINE 
sto OVER EASY Arts and the 
Older Person1 Guest: Mrs. 
Joan Mondale, wife of Vice- 
President Mondale. Hosts: 
Hugh Downs and Frank Blair. 
(Closed-Captioned; U.S.A.) 
ffi BARNEY MILLER 

7:00 
GOOD TIMES 
M.A.S.H. 
FAMILY FEUD 
PUBLIC REPORT 
BIONIC WOMAN 

7'30 
LEGENDS: ELEANOR 

ROOSEVELT: AN UN- 
COMMON WOMAN An ex- 
clusive documentary that 
provides new insight into the 
life of the legendary first lady. 

WELCOME BACK KOTTER 
M.A.S.H. 
TICTAC DOUGH 

MACNEIL LEHRER 
:port 

8:00 
MOVIE -(THRILLER) * * 'Night 
Of The Juggler" 1980 James 
Brolin. An ex-cop's daughter 
is mistakenly kidnapped by a 

psycopathic criminal. (Rated 
R) (2 nrs.) 

S LITTLE HOUSE ON THE 
AIRIE Laura and Almanzo 

soon learn they've made a 
mistake by agreeing to babysit 
for his brother’s two young 
sons, until Laura sets out to 
teach the boys a lesson in 
manners. (60 mins.) (Closed- 
Captioned; U.S.A.) 
0 STAR TREK 
©FLO tffi GREAT PERFORMANCES: 
CORONATION OF POPPEA 
Derek Jacobi introduces this 
production of Claudio Mon- 
teverdi's baroque master- 

piece. Staged and directed by 
Jean-Pierre Ponnelle, and set 
in first century Rome, the 
opera tells the story of the 
intrigue and betrayal by which 
Poppea persuades the Em- 
peror Nero to place her on the 
throne and banish his wife 
Octavia. (3 hrs.) 
ffi THAT'S INCREDIBLE A 
death-defying motorcycle 
stuntman challenges a 

speeding car to a daring duel 
inside a tunnel of fire, a 
severely handicapped, 
retarded young man displays 
the amazing musical gifts that 
fate has given him, and a 
victim of the mysterious fiery 
force Known as spontaneous 
human combustion. (60 mins.) 

8:30 
O LADIES' MAN 

9:00 
O MONDAY NIGHT AT THE 
MOVIES 'When Hell Was in 
Session’ 1979 Stars: Hal 
Holbrook, Eva Marie Saint. A 
drama based on the real-life 
story of a U.S. Navy Com- 
mander, shot down over 
Vietnam, who survived brutal 
torture for seven-and-one-half 
years as a prisoner of war 
while organizing a resistance 
movement among other 
POWs. (Repeat; 2 hrs.) 
0 MOVIE-(DRAMA) 
TTounterfeit Green1 1971 David 
Janssen. Richard Jackel. (2 
hrs.) 
O M.A.S.H. Hawkeye tries to 
break out of his batting slump 
with the 4077th nurses by 
going to bat with a bottle of 
vintage French wine, 
ffi DYNASTY The threat of 
financial disaster disrupts 
Blake and Krystle's global 

honeymoon when foreign 
rebels take over his com- 

pany’s oil tankers, while 
daughter Fallon makes a deal 
with one of Blake's biggest 
competitors that she may live 
to regret. (60 mins.) 

9‘30 
O HOUSE CALLS 

10:00 
THE CANDID CANDID 

CAMERA Alan Funt travels all 
over the country to catch the 
unsuspecting in very 
precarious situations, 
o LOU GRANT Lou's 
authority and ego are un- 
dermined by an old pal. a high- 
paid writer working on a story 
about dumping-the practice 
of sending dangerous or 
defective goods overseas. (60 
mins.) 
ffi ALL-STAR INAUGURAL 
GALA President-elect Ronald 
Reagan and his family. Vice 
President-elect George Bush 
and his family, and members 
of the new Cabinet will be 
honored in a spectacular 
entertainment event featuring 
some of the country's biggest 
stars. The entertainment for 
the momentous event will be 
produced by Frank Sinatra and 
emceed by Johnny Carson. (2 
hrs.) 

10:30 
LEGENDS: ELEANOR 

ROOSEVELT: AN UN- 
COMMON WOMAN An ex- 
clusive documentary that 
provides new insight into the 
life of the legendary first lady. 

11:00 
MOVIE -(SCIENCE-FICTION) ** 

"Close Encounters Of The 
Third Kind" 1980 Richard 
Dreyfuss, Francois Truffaut. 

C/4.CE UPHOLSTERY 
Our Specialty 

CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY 
AND DRAPERIES 

Qualified Craftsmanship 

Custom Draperies & Window Casings 
Large Selection Of Fabrics And Naugahyde 

Big Discounts On Plastic Jobs 

Free Estimates 
Free Pickup & Delivery 

647-5880 
1058 Rancho Drive 


