
ALI WANTS FIGHT 

New York Muham- 
mad Ali said Thursday 
he is going to fight 
European heavyweight 
champion John L. Gard- 
ner. and while saying 
the fight is not signed, 
promoter Harold Smith 
did say Ali “has asked 
me to make the fight.” 

Ali. the three-time 
champion, made his an- 

nouncement in London. 

Then, in Chicago. Her- 
bert Muhammad Ali’s 
manager, said there 
have been negotiations, 
but “Ali has not signed 
and I have not signed 
and I have exclusive 
rights.” 

In Las Vegas. British 
promoter Mickey Duff, 
who said he was Gard- 
ner’s manager, said Gar- 
dner had not signed a 

contract but has signed 
a letter of intent with 
Harold Smith, president 
of Muhammad Ali 
Professional Sports. Inc. 

Smith, president of 
MAPS. told The 
Associated Press by 
telephone from Los 
Angeles. “This is Ali’s 
fight.” 
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