
Saturday 
SATURDAY 
NOV. 1,1900 

MORNING 

5:00 
Q ODD COUPLE 

5:30 
O LUCY SHOW 

6:00 

8 
SIX MILLION DOLLAR MAN 
NEWS 
SUNRISE SEMESTER 

6:30 

S EM BASS ADORES DE 
LUMBIAN MUSIC 

ffi BATTLE OF THE PLANETS 
7:00 

Q GODZILLA-DYNOMUTT; 
ASK NBC NEWS 
Q BUGS BUNNY; YOGI, 
PuPEYE AND FRIENDS 

S RESUME DE NOTICIAS 
HEATHCLIFF-DINGBT 

7:15 
O COMMUNITY SATURDAY 

O SPOKEN WORD 
© FONZ AND THE HAPPY 
Days gang 

8:00 
© FRED AND BARNEY MEET 
SHMOO; ASK NBC NEWS 
Q MIGHTY MOUSE, HECKLE- 
JfcCKLE; IN THE NEWS 
CE) SCOOBY DOO-RICHIE 
RICH; SCHOOL. ROCK 

O TOM AND JERRY COMEDY 
SHOW; IN THE NEWS 

9:00 
©MOVIE -(WESTERN) ** 

"Not Above Suspicion" 1951 
Clayton Moore, Jay 
Silverheels. The Lone Ranger 
and Tonto fight a ruthless 
outlaw who rules a small town 
with an iron fist. (90 mins.) 
© BUGS BUNNY AND ROAD 
RUNNER; IN THE NEWS 
(E) NCAA FOOTBALL 

DAFFY DUCK; ASK NBC © DA 
NEWS 

QE 
SEV 

10:00 
BATMAN AND THE SUPER 
EN 

10:30 
©MOVIE -(WESTERN) *** 

"Rio Granae" 1950 John 
Wayne, Maureen O'Hara. The 
US. Cavalry, led by a tough- 
commander, attempts to stop 
Apache raids during the In- 
dian-Mexican border wars. (2 
hrs.) 
© POPEYE; IN THE NEWS 

11:00 
© JONNY QUEST; TIME OUT 

11:30 
DRAWING POWER 

DRAK PACK; IN 
QDR 
O D 
NEWS 

THE 

AFTERNOON 

12:00 
| SIX MILLION DOLLAR MAN 

ALBERT; IN THE Q SIX MIL 
It FAT 
NEWS'A' 12:30 
CSMOVlE -(ADVENTURE- 
DRAMA) ** "Art of Crime" 
1975 Ron Leibman, Jose 
Ferrer. A sophisticated New 
York Gypsy antique dealer 
turns to criminology in an 

attempt to clear a Gypsy ac- 
cused of homocide. (2 hrs.) 
o LONE ranger-tarzan 
ADVENTURES; IN THE NEWS 
(E) NCAA FOOTBALL 

1:00 
0 SPORTSWORLD 1) Boxing: 
Tomorrow's Champions from 
Lake Tahoe. 2) Legends Of 
Bowling.(90 mins.)^ 

1:30 ** 

O WHATS AN ELECTION 
ALL ABOUT? 

2:00 
O KIDSWORLD 

2:30 
0 ODD COUPLE 
QMOVIE -(ADVENTURE- 
DHAMA) *** "Sands of 
Kalahari" 1965 Stuart Whit- 
man, Stanley Baker. Six 
survivors of an airplane crash 
fight for survival in Africa's 
dangerous Kalahari Desert. (2 
hrs.) 
Q NFL REVIEW AND 
PREVIEW 

3:00 
O FLYING SPORTSMAN 
flu CINE EN ESPANOL 

3*30 
MOVIE -(ROMANCE) 
'Something Short 

Paradise" 1979 susan 
Sarandon, David Steinberg. 
Two young New Yorkers learn 
about love and explore the ups 
and downs of a one to one 

relationship. (Rated PG) (87 
mins.) 
©VARSITY QUIZ 
0 SPORTS SPECTACULAR 1) 
Battle of the NFL 
Cheerleaders, Pt. I, featuring 
cheerleaders competing in 
various sporting events. 2) 
Acapulco Cliff Diving from 
Lake Tahoe. (90 mins.) 

Of 

MINOR KEY 
THUNDARI 

DANNIE 
4:30 

0 VEGASCOPE 

RR; DEAI lR ALEX 

^aptuife V'our tueddin^ in 
unf©iti5ettable eeler? phete^ifaphs! 

Imagine the thrill for you and 
your children when, ten years from 
now, you open your wedding 
album and see it all over again. 
Your dress, your husband with the 
ring, the families and friends. 

Why not arrange with us for 
your wedding photography. We 

offer candid coverage at the 
church or chapel and the 
reception, also striking portraits. 
And ours are fine quality 
professional color photographs at 
reasonable rates 

Call us now We ll make your 
wedding truly unforgettable! 

(702) 453-2010 By appointment only Bob Morgan 

uAAo/tgan 
Freelance Photography 

a LETS ROCK 
E SUPERFRIENDS HOUR; 
School, rock 

5:00 
HBO NOVEMBER SNEAK 

PREVIEW 
O FORREST DUKE SHOW 
E§ SOLID GOLD* 
O LAWRENCE WELK SHOW 
© PRESENTE 

5:30 
SRO: GLEN CAMPBELL- 

rANYA TUCKER 
O NBC NEWS 
© WASHINGTON WEEK IN 
REVIEW 
© PLASTICMAN PAMILY; 
DEAR ALEX AND ANNIE 

EVENING 

6:00 

P> 55 wa 

NEWS 
ANA NA 

WALL STREET WEEK Host 
_ouis Rukeyser reviews the 
atest developments on the 
inancial scene. 

E HOUSE DETECTIVE 

AMERICAN BODYBUILDING 
CHAMPIONSHIPS 
□ ACTION SENIORS 
P MUPPET SHOW Guest: 
tony Randall. 
□ CBS NEWS 
55 ALL CREATURES GREAT 
AND SMALL 
E CARTER COUNTRY 

7:00 
□ GUNSMOKE ^ 

0 BATTLESTAR GALACTICA 
Q HEE HAW Guests: Tom T. 
Hall, Jeanne Pruett, Henny 
/oungman. (60 nrrtns.) 
©FLIP WILSON^ 
MOVIE -(FANTASY) **% 
"Arabian Adventure" 1979 
Christopher Lee, Mickey 
Rooney. Take a journey 
complete with genies, giants 
and magic carpets as a young 
prince battles an evil sorcerer 
to win the hand of a beautiful 
captive princess. (Rated G) (98 
mins.) 
ffi) HERE'S TO YOUR HEALTH 
The Drug Industry' (Closed- 
Captioned) 

8:00 
Q SATURDAY NIGHT AT THE 
MOVIES The Car' 1977 Stars: 
James Brolin, Kathleen Lloyd. 
A sheriff hunts a driverless car 
that is terrorizing his small 
Utah town with hit-and-runs. (2 
hrs.) 

O STAR TREK 'Who Mourns 
For Adonais' ? (60 mins.) 
O WKRP IN CINCINNATI In an 
effort to be more competitive 
with a rival radio station, Les 
Nessman takes it upon him- 
self to park his mobile news 
scooter and cover the news in 
a World War I biplane flown by 
a crazy war veteran. (Season- 
Premiere) 

|J0 CONNECTIONS Wheel of 
Fortune' Narrator James 
Burke looks at the relationship 
between the modern 
production line and the in- 
vention of the clock. Burke 

illustrates how the 
accuracy spurred 

need for 
develop- 

ment of precision tools, which 
in turn made mass production 
and automation possible. 
(Closed-Captioned) (60 mins.) 
(E) THE LOVE BOAT Romance 
and comic intrigue reign on 
the high seas as fifty engaged 
couples board the Pacific 
Princess to compete in a 

marriage-a-thon cruise. 
(Season-Premiere; 2 hrs.) 

o THE TIM CONWAY SHOW 
9:00 

Q JACK VAN IMPE 
Q SPECIAL MOVIE 
PRESENTATION The Return 
Of Frank Cannon' 1980 Stars: 
William Conrad, Diana 
Muldaur. Private eye Frank 
Cannon comes out of self- 
imposed retirement to in- 
vestigate the questionable 
suicide of an old friend and 
former Army Intelligence 
colleague. (2 hrs.) 
(E) VIKINGS! 'England at Bay' 
A re-created clash between 
the Viking hordes and King 
Alfred the Great highlights this 
episode exploring Viking raids 
on England. 

9:30 
MOVIE -(ROMANCE) ** 

"Something Short Of 
Paradise'' 1979 susan 
Sarandon, David Steinberg. 
Two young New Yorkers learn 
about love and explore the ups 
and downs of a one to one 
relationship. (Rated PG) (87 
mins.) 
O WESTGATE REPORT 
CTD ONCE UPON A CLASSIC 
(Ulosed-Captioned) 

10:00 
O PEOPLE SPEAK 
ffi) MATINEE AT THE BIJOU 
Winds of the Wastelands' 
John Wayne stars in this 
action-packed tale of the 
stagecoach days out west. 
Also shown will be a newsreel, 
a cartoon and the continuation 
of the serial 'Junior G-Men'. 
(90 mins.) 
ffi FANTASY ISLAND A 
spoiled mermaid exchanges 
her tail for a shapely female 
figure so she can experience 
human love. Guest stars: 
Michelle Phillips, Tom Wopat. 
(Season-Premiere; 60 mins.) 

10:30 
Q RALPH PEARL SHOW 

11:00 
ON THE WAY TO THE WHITE 
HOUSE 

§QNEWS SECOND CITY TELEVISION 
ABC NEWS 

11:15 
(E) NORM CROSBY SHOW 

OSA 
QMC 
F1CTK 

11:30 
i SATURDAY NIGHT LIVE 
IMOVIE -(SCIENCE- 

ION) "End Of The 
World" Christopher Lee. 
Strange messages from outer 
space predict disasters and 
foretell of alien visits to our 

planet. (PG) (2 hrs.) 

QMOVIE -(WESTERN) *** 

"El Dorado" 1967 John 
Wayne, Robert Mitchum. A 
rancher with a paralyzed right 

For All Your Musical Needs 
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Daily 10 A-1 OP 
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811 W. Owens 648-4444 

hand from a spinal wound and 
his friend, a drunken sheriff on 
crutches from a leg wound, 
join forces to rout a killer and 
his gang. (105 mins.) 

JAZZ AT THE MAIN- 
iNANCE SHOP+ 

11:4o 
©MOVIE -(DRAMA) *** 

"Fate Is the Hunter" 1964 
Glenn Ford, Nancy Kwan. 
After a routine flight ends in 
disaster, a pilot is accused of 
negligence. A company VIP 
sets out to prove his in- 
nocence even if it means re- 
enacting the fatal flight. (2 
hrs.) 

12:00 
MOVIE-(COMEDY)** "Gorp" 1980 Dennis Quaid. Wnat 
crazy shenanigans could 
possibly erupt at a Jewish 
summer camp in the heart of 
the Catskill mountains? The 
counselors of Camp Oskemo 
will show you. (Rated R) (89 
mins.) 

1:00 
©MOVIE -(COMEDY) **Vfe 
"Viva Maxi" 1964 Peter 
Ustinov, Pamela Tiffin. An 
eccentric Mexican general 
recaptures the Alamo, sen- 

ding an equally inept 
American Militia to rout him 
out. (2 hrs.) 

1:15 
©SIG'S SUPERSTAR 

1:30 
MOVIE-(COMEDY) ** "Disco 
Beaver From Outer Space" 
1979 Roger Bumpass, Peter 
Elbling. A horror show about a 
homosexual vampire and a 

game where the answer to 
every question is breast are 

just a few things intermingled 
in a story of the giant disco 
beaver from outer space who 
landed in New York City and is 
running amok eating all of the 
wood in sight. (Rated R) (60 
mins.) 
©MOVIE -(ADVENTURE- 
DRAMA) ** "Art of Crime" 
1975 Ron Leibman, Jose 
Ferrer. A sophisticated New 
York Gypsy antique dealer 
turns to criminology in an 
attempt to clear a Gypsy ac- 
cused of homocide. (90 mins.) 

1:45 
©NEWS 
©MOVIE-(COMEDY)*** "Up 
tne Down Staircase" 1967 
Sandy Dennis, Patrick Bed- 
ford. A young English 
literature teacher is con- 

tinually harassed by the fact 
that her students are all from 
lower-income homes and 
hostile environments. (2 hrs.) 

2:15 
©MOVIE -(MYSTERY) **% 
"Take One False Step" 1949 
William Powell, Shelley 
Winters. A professor becomes 
a murder suspect when a girl 
disappears, leaving behind a 
blood stained scarf. (2 hrs.) 

3:00 
©NEWS 
©MOVIE -(ADVENTURE- 
DRAMA) *** "Sands of 
Kalahari" 1965 Stuart Whit- 
man, Stanley Baker. Six 
survivors of an airplane crash 
fight for survival in Africa's 
dangerous Kalahari Desert. (2 
hrs.) 

3‘30 
©MOVIE -(WESTERN) *** 

"Sons Of Katie Elder*' 1965 
John Wayne, Dean Martin. The 
four rowdy sons of a frontier 
woman set out to avenge her 
death. (90 mins.) 

5:00 
©MOVIE -(SCIENCE FICTION) 
"vfe "It Came From Outer 
Space" 1953 Richard Carlson, 
Barbara Rush. An alien rocket 
crashing in the desert causes 
trouble for the people of a 
small town. (60 mins.) 

Sunday 
SUNDAY 
NOV. 2,1980 

MORNING 

6:00 

8 NEWS 
SUNDAY MORNING 

OVAL DE LA 6 SHOW 

YOGI, 

IFI UlriCL) I KJlNo 
7:00 

§ HERALD OF TRUTH 
VILLA ALEGRE 
PRINCIPLES OF SUCCESS 

7:30 
O JERRY FALWELL 
Q INFINITY FACTORY 
0 JEWISH VOICE 
©HOUR OF POWER 

8:00 
0 BUGS BUNNY, 
POPEYE AND FRIENDS 
O REX HUMBARD 

tDAY 
OF DISCOVERY 

JONNY QUEST 
KIDS ARE PEOPLE TOO; 

*R ALEX AND ANNIE 
9:00 

§ 
ORAL ROBERTS 
DUDLEY DO-RIGHT 
CHANNEL8JOURNAL 

9:30 
0 NFL'80 a 

0 LITTLE RASCALS IT 
0 JOURNEY TO AD- 
VENTURE 
©LASSIE 

10:00 
Q NFL FOOTBALL 
O AMERICAN HANDGUN 
WAR 
©MOVIE -{DRAMA) **% 
™Kona Coast" 1968 Richard 
Boone, Vera Miles. A fishing 
boat skipper tries to nail the 
guys who murdered his 
daughter. (2hrs.) 

10:30 
0MOVIE -{ADVENTURE) ** 

TTLassie,s Great Adventure" 
1964 John Provost, June 
Lockhart. Lassie and her 
owner are stranded in the 
Canadian wilderness. (2 hrs.) 
QMOVIE -{ADVENTURE- 
DRAMA) ** "Golden Voyage 
Of Slnbad" 1973 John Phillip 
Law, Caroline Munro. Captain 
Sinbad battles an evil prince 
who seeks to steal an amulet 
which is part of a medallion 
which will lead to a fabulous 
treasure. (90 mins.) 

AFTERNOON 

12:00 
QNFLSYMFUNNY 
© MASTERPIECE THEATRE 
vride and Prejudice1 Episode 
I. This five-part dramatization 
of Jane Austin's satirical 
classic opens with Mrs. 
Bennet eying Mr. Bingley as a 

good and rightful marriage 
prospect for one of her five 
daughters. (Open-Captioned) 
(60 mins.) 
© MARY TYLER MOORE 

12:30 
QMOVIE -(DRAMA) ** 

"Counterpoint" 1968 
Charlton Heston, Maximilian 
Schell. While on a USO tour 
during WW.II, an eminent 
American symphonic con- 
ductor and his orchestra are 
taken prisoners by the Ger- 
mans, but manage to outwit 
their crafty captors. (2 hrs.) 

8 THE NFL TODAY 
COLLEGE FOOTBALL'80 

1:00 
Q NFL FOOTBALL 
P NFL FOOTBALL New 
Orleans Saints vs Los Angeles 
Rams 

© CONNECTIONS ’Wheel of 
Fortune' Narrator James 
Burke looks at the relationship 
between the modern 
production line and the in- 
vention of the clock. Burke 
illustrates how the need for 
accuracy spurred develop- 
ment of precision tools, which 
in turn made mass production 
and automation possible. 
(Closed-Captioned) (60 mins.) 
© ISSUES AND ANSWERS 

1:30 
© DEBATE 

2:00 
CTn GREAT PERFORMANCES 
Tinker, Sailor, Soldier, Spy' 
Part V. Using Prideaux's 
terrible story, George Smiley 
threads his way through the 
maze which he hopes will lead 
him to Gerald, the Russian 
'mole'. (Closed-Captioned) (60 
mins.) 

ffi IRONSIDE 
2:30 

©MOVIE -(DRAMA) *** 

Strange Possession Of Mrs. 
Oliver" 1977 Karen Black, 
George Hamilton. A young 
ordinary housewife, tired of 
her routine, changes her 


