
problems. (107 mins.) 
0 REAL PEOPLE An elephant 
that roller skates, a visit with 
Harry Blackstone Jr., the 
magician, and home made 
boat races on the Beaver River 
in Oregon. (Repeat; 60 mins.) 
(Closed-Captioned) 
0 STREETS OF SAN 
FRANCISCO 
Q FUNNY BUSINESS Walter 
Matthau is host of the 
retrospective, which features 
more than 100 glimpses of 
movie favorites from the 
beginning of sound in motion 
pictures up to the 1950's. 
Among jthe many stars ap- 
pearing in historic films are 
W.C. Fields, Mae West, Laurel 
and Hardy, and the Marx 
Brothers. (2 hrs.) 
© THE SHAKESPEARE 
PLAYS Twelfth Night' This 
comedy of misplaced love, 
mistaken identity and revenge 
stars Felicity Kendall and 
Sinead Cusack. (2 hrs. 30 
mins.) 
ffi EIGHT IS ENOUGH Nancy 
finds herself in the midst of an 
unusual love triangle when her 
relationship with a man who 
wants to marry her becomes 
complicated by a third party, 
his five-year old daughter. 
(Repeat; 60 mins.) (Closed- 
Captioned) 

9:00 

O^DIFF' RENT STROKES 
Arnold doesn't know his pet 
goldfish died but he thinks his 
father is about to. (Repeat) 
0MOVIE -(DRAMA) •**% 
"Deadly Tower" 1975 Kurt 
Russell. Richard Yniguez. A 
dramatization of the sniping 
attacks on forty-six people by 
a deranged man in the 
University of Texas tower, and 
the police efforts to capture 
him. (2 hrs.) 
©CHARLIE'S ANGELS 

9-30 
oSANFORD-# 
RACE FOR THE PENNANT 
Q QUINCY A gunshot victim, 
treated by a young doctor at 
an emergency clinic, is dead 
on arrival at the main hospital 
from a second wound ap- 
parently overlooked earlier, 
and Quincy must find out if the 
physician is guilty of man- 

slaughter. (Repeat: 60 mins.) 

SCBS NEWS HOUR 
VEGAS Dan Tanna's 

reputation and life are on the 
line when a desperate casino 

owner frames Dan for the 
murder of two party girls. 
(Repeat; 60 mins.) (Closed- 
Captioned) 

10:30 
THE CANDID CANDID 

CAMERA A racier version of 
the popular series. 
{£) MACNEIL LEHRER 
REPORT 

11:00 
MOVIE -(MUSICAL) *** 

"Hair" 1979 John Savage, 
Melba Moore. Warm and 
humorous look at the tur- 
bulent 60s and the 'Age of 
Aquarius.' (Rated PG)(2hrs.) 
OQffi news 
0 BENNY HILL 
fly VEGAS DIGEST 

11:30 
O THEJLTONIGHT SHOW 
Host: Johnny Carson. Guests: 
Johnny Mathis. George Segal, 
Elizabeth Ashley. (90 mins.) 

(p PRISONER: CELL BLOCK 

O U.S. OPEN TENNIS UP- 
DATE Highlights of the day's 
action of the U.S. Open Tennis 
Championship. 
CD DICK CAVETT SHOW 
ffi ABC NEWS NIGHTLINE 

11:50 
CB LOVE BOAT-BARETTA 
Love Boat--'Take My Grand- 
daughter. Please' A woman 
selects the ship's doctor for 
her spinster granddaughter 
who prefers someone else. 
Baretta--'Who Can Make The 
Sun Shine' Baretta sets out to 
nail a drug dealer who has 
built up a clientele among pre- 
teen children. (Repeat; 2 hrs.. 
is mins.) 

12:00 
©MOVIE -(DRAMA) *** 

"Expresso Bongo" 1960 
Laurence Harvey. Sylvia 
Syms. An opportunistic talent 
agent almost makes the big 
Time wun a Dongo playing 
discovery, but bluffs himself 
into the small time. (2 hrs.) 
o CBS LATE MOVIE THE 
SAINT: The Angel's Eye' Lord 
Cranmore must sell his famed 
diamond, but his nephew 
objects. (Repeat) 
'SIDEWINDER ONE' 1977 
Stars: Michael Parks, Susan 
Howard. 

1:00 
OTOMORROW 

2:00 

gNEWS MOVIE -(MYSTERY) * 

"Murder Motel" 1975 Robyn 
Millan. Derek Francis. A 

Your 
Paycheck 

brother and sister who flee 
with stolen company funds 
seek refuge in a motel where 
they encounter a lethal kind of 
room service. (90 mins.) 

2:10 
ffiCOMEDY SHOP 

2'30 

8 BONANZA 
NEWS 

2:40 
© NEWS 

3'30 

gLUCY SHOW 
MOVIE -(DRAMA) **% 

"Firechasers" 1970 Chad 
Everett. Anjanette Comer. 
Insurance investigator sets 
out to find an arsonist. (2 hrs.) 

4:00 
©ODD COUPLE 

430 
© SIX MILLION DOLLAR MAN 

5'30 
Q FACE THE MUSIC 

Thursday 
THURSDAY 
AUG. 28,1980 

EVENING 

6:00 

§0 
NEWS 

BOB NEWHART SHOW 
MARY TYLER MOORE 

6:30 
O WELCOME BACK KOTTER 
o INDEPENDENT NETWORK 
NEWS 
O PM MAGAZINE 
© TO BE ANNOUNCED 
©ALL IN THE FAMILY 

7:00 
O JIM ROCKFORD, PRIVATE 
INVESTIGATOR 
QM.A.S.H. 
©HAPPY DAYS AGAIN 
© ATTENTION 
ffi STARSKY AND HUTCH 

7" 30 
CHARLIE CHAPLIN: THE 

LITTLE TRAMP Joel Grey 
introduces clips form the 
screen comic's best films. (60 
mins.) 

S CAROL BURNETT AND 
IENDS 

SI FAMILY FEUD 
DNEWSNIGHT NEVADA 

8:00 
O GAMES PEOPLE PLAY 
© STREETS OF SAN 
FRANCISCO 
Q THE WALTONS Grandpa 
Walton's spirit is resurrected 
through an eccentric 86-year- 
old Walton cousin, who the 
family suspects has come to 
the mountain to die. (Repeat; 
60 mins.) 
© BILL MOYERS' JOURNAL 
'No Easy Walk to Freedom' 
Bill Moyers talks with Nelson 
Mandella. as portrayed by 
actor James Earl Jones. The 
reason Moyers cannot in- 
terview Mandella personally is 
that he is presently serving a 
life sentence in prison for his 
role in the struggle for equality 
in South Africa. (60 mins.)-^r 
ffi MORK AND MINDY * 

8:30 
SRO: LINDA RONSTADT 
©ANGIE 

9:00 
© THURSDAY NIGHT AT THE 
MOVIES 'Backstairs At The 
wmte Mouse lyry btars: 
Olivia Cole, Leslie Uggams. 
Lillian Rogers mourns the 
deaths of her mother and 
President Roosevelt. Lillian is 
temporarily dismissed from 
White House service when 
Harry Truman moves his 
family to Blair House. (Con- 
clusion; 2 a hrs.) (Closed- 
Captioned; ^ 
©MOVIE -(DRAMA) * 'Time 
For Loving" 1971 Mel Ferrer. 
Joanna Shimkus. Story 
revolves around three men 
and their different love affairs. 
(2 hrs.) 
O BARNABY JONES J.R.'s 
friend and fellow law student, 
Wes Carter, flees the scene of 
a murder because he fears of 
being accused of the crime 
because he's black. (Repeat: 
60 mins.) 

SD DIFFERENT DRUMMER: 
LVIN JONES The musical 

imagination of modern jazz 
pioneer Elvin Jones is ex- 

plored by focusing on a single 
composition. -^rThree Card 
Mollv'. 

THREE 
Machine' 

ffi BARNEY MILLbH Barney 
must cope with a jazz trum- 
peter who makes the streets 
his stage and a fanatic who 
has waged a war against 
microwaves. (Repeat) 
(Closed-Captioned) 

9‘30 
QD CAMERA 
'American Dance 
This ensemble performs to 
music from Broadway and the 
movies of the 30's, 40's and 
50’s. 

SC) NOBODY'S PERFECT 
etective Roger Hart has 

himself thrown in jail and 
engineers an escape with a 
bank robber to learn where the 
man has hidden the loot. 

10:00 
MOVIE -(DRAMA) **** 

"Norma Rae" 1979 Sally 
Field. Beau Bridges. Brilliant 
portrait of a woman in today's 
society. Suffused with humor 
and glowing with warmth. 
(Rated PG) 014 mins.) 
o KNOTS LANDING Gary, 
who after many a bout with the 
bottle has learned to handle 
bad luck and hard knocks, 
can't deal with sudden good 
fortune and disappears on a 

drinking binge. (Repeat: 60 
mins.) 

80 ABC CAPTIONED NEWS 
D20-20 

10:30 
© MACNEIL 
REPORT 

11:00 
©©© NEWS 
©BENNY HILL 
© VEGAS DIGEST 

11:30 
© THE TONIGHT SHOW 
Host: Johnny Carson. Guests: 
Sally Field, Jim Stafford, 
Sydney Goldsmith. (90 mins.) 
© PRISONER: CELL BLOCK 

LEHRER 

© U.S. OPEN TENNIS UP- 
DATE 
© DICK CAVETT SHOW 
© ABC NEWS NIGHTLINE 

11:50 
© CHARLIE'S ANGELS- 
BARETTA Charlie's Angels- 
'Angels Belong In Heaven' A 
smooth-talking embezzler 
marks Kelly for murder. 
Baretta--'The Sky Is Falling' 
Baretta launches a search for 
a 13-year-old witness to a 
murder. (Repeat; 2 hrs., 15 
mins.) 

12:00 
HBO SNEAK PREVIEW Stiller 

and Meara make light of the 
forthcoming HBO offerings. 
® MOVIE -(DRAMA) ** 

"Forbidden Alliance" 1934 
Norma Shearer. Fredric 
March. Famous Victorian love 
story of poets Elizabeth 
Barrett and Robert Browning, 
and her father's jealousy 
which nearly destroyed their 
love. (2 hrs.) 
o CBS LATE .MOVIE 'THE 
JEFFERSONS;^ Louise's 
Daughter' What do you do 
when a stranger confronts you 
with evidence that you are her 
mother? (Repeat) 'THE 
ULTIMATE CHASE' 1974 Stars: 
Britt Ekland. Eric Braeden. 

12:30 
BEST OF: ON LOCATION 

obert Klein introduces the 
videotape hightlights from 
past HBO specials. Robin 
Williams. Richard. Steve 
Martin. George Carlin, et. al.. 
perform. (90 mins.) 

1:00 
O TOMORROW 

2:00 

OMOVIE -(MYSTERY) ** 

"Death In Deep Water" 1975 
Bradford Dillman. Suzan 
Farmer. A former member, of 
an American crime syndicate 
attempts to escape his pur- 
suing former colleagues in a 
remote British Village. (90 
mins.) 

2:10 
© NEWS 

2'30 
Q FORREST DUKE SHOW 
O NEWS 

3:00 
0MOVIE -(COMEDY) **1/2 
^Wever Too Late" 1965 Paul 
Ford. Connie Stevens. The 
story of a middle-aged couple 
who find they are expectant 
parents again. (2 hrs.) 

3:30 
©MOVIE -(SCIENCE-DRAMA) 

"Earth II" 1971 Tony 
Franciosa. Gary Lockwood. 
Space station nation. Earth II, 
inhabited by 2.000 persons. 

functions as a labratory and an 
'eye in space.' (2 hrs.) 

5:00 
OODD COUPLE 

530 
O FACE THE MUSIC 

Friday 
FRIDAY 
AUG. 29,1980 

AFTERNOON 

4:30 
ONEWS 

5:00 
0 NBC NEWS 

5:30 

So NFL 
TBALL 

PRE-SEASON 
GAME Seattle 

Seahawks vs New England 
Patriots 

EVENING 

6:00 

§ 
BOB NEWHART SHOW 
NEWS 
MARY TYLER MOORE 

6:30 
0 INDEPENDENT NETWORK 
NEWS 
O PM MAGAZINE 
85 TO BE ANNOUNCED 
ffi ALL IN THE FAMILY 

7:00 
0M.A.S.H. 
© HAPPY DAYS AGAIN 
85 PUBLIC REPORT 
ffi STARSKY AND HUTCH 

7:30 
SKY SPORTS SPECTACULAR 
'1.500 aircraft from 50 coun- 
tries populate the Oshkosh Air 
Show, the largest sports- 
aviation event in the world. 
0 CAROL BURNETT AND 
FRIENDS 

SI MATCH GAME 
5 NEWSNIGHT NEVADA 

8:00 
MOVIE -(MUSICAL) **** 

"Cabaret” 1972 Liza Minnelli, 
Joel Grey. Set in a Berlin 
cabaret in 1931, the rising tide 
of Nazism affects the lives of 
several individuals. (118 mins.) 
0MOVIE -(DRAMA) *** 

"Home In Indiana" 1944 
Walter Brennan. Jeanne 
Crain. One-time famous sulky 
driver gains renewed spirit 
when nephew arranges to 
breed his remaining mare, 
resulting in a champion. (2 
hrs.) 
o THE INCREDIBLE HULK 
The audience thinks it is part- 
of the act when the Hulk 
rushes on stage to save a rock 
star's life. (Repeat: 60 mins.) 
© WASHINGTON WEEK IN 
REVIEW 
ffi BENSON Benson has to do 
some fancy footwork when the 
governor decides late one 

night to find out what's really 
on the minds of his con- 
stituents. (Repeat)-^- 

8:30 * 

O HERE'S BOOMER 
© WALL STREET WEEK 
'Making Economic Policy' 
Host: Louis Rukheyser. 
©GOODTIME GIRLS 

9:00 

P 
MEETING HOUSE 
THE DUKES OF HAZZARD 
Texas Ranger enlists the 

Dukes' help to track down a 

dangerous outlaw hiding in 
the swamp. (60 mins.) 

SO OLD FRIENDS, NEW 
ilENDS 'Henry John Heinz 

III' (Closed Captioned) 
fl FRIDAY NIGHT MOVIE 

iller Grizzly' 1976 Stars: 
Christopher .George, Andrew 
Prine. A beautiful forest 
ranger and a mother 
protecting her child are among 
the victims as an 18-foot. 2.000 
pound bear goes kill-crazy. (2 
hrs.) 

9:30 
© PAVAROTTI AT JUILLIARD 
Tenor Luciano Pavarotti 
coaches three students: Ronit 
Kalisky singing 'Una Voce 
Pocofa': Zehave Gal singing 
'Val Laisse Couler Meslar- 
mes': and Robert Briggs 
singing the aria 'Vecchia 
Zimarra' from La Boheme. 

10:00 
GREATEST SCANDAI S OF 

THE CENTURY Rare film 
footage, still photographs, and 
courtroom testimony re-create 
the media-inspired scandals 
of the past. (60 mins.) 
© BLACKSTONE' S MAGIC 
© STREET OF SAN FRAN- 
CISCO 
O DALLAS As a new 
assistant district attorney, Cliff 
Barnes jumps at the chance to 
work on the investigation of 
the body found at Southfork. 
(Repeat: 60 mins.) 
© ABC CAPTIONED NEWS 

10:30 
© MACNEIL LEHRER 
REPORT 

11:00 
MOVIE -(DRAMA) **** 

"Norma Rae" 1979 Sally 
Field. Beau Bridges. Brilliant 
portrait of a woman in today's 
society. Suffused with humor 
and glowing with warmth. 
(Rated PG) (114 mins.) 
OQ©NEWS 
©BENNY HILL 
© VEGAS DIGEST 

11:30 
© THE TONIGHT SHOW 
© PRISONER: CELL BLOCK 

S) U.S. OPEN TENNIS UP- 
ATE Highlights of the day's 

action of the U.S. Open Tennis 
Championships. 

B DICK CAVETT SHOW 1 FRIDAYS 
12:00 

©MOVIE -(COMEDY) ** 

"Broadway Melody" 1929 
Anita Page, Bessie Love. 
Vaudivillians smash Broadway 
with a new show, their en- 

tanglements in love and fame. 
(2hrs.> + 
© CBS LATE MOVIE 'THE 
AVENGERS: Fifty Thousand 
Pound Breakfast' A man with a 
stomach full of diamonds is 
only a pawn in a larger scheme 
involving a wealthy in- 
dustrialist. (Repeat) 'CRIME 
KNOWS NO AGE' ^973 Stars: 
Miicneii riyan, uary ^rosuy. 

12:40 
©MOVIE -(ADVENTURE) **1/2 
Tsiege Of The Saxons" 1963 
Janette Scott, Ronald Lewis. 
King Arthur's daughter tries to 
protect her kingdom and her 
right to marry the knight she 
chooses. (95 mins.) 

1:00 
MOVIE -(SUSPENSE) **V2 
"Breaking Point" 1977 Bo 
Svenson, Robert Culp. When 
mobsters launch a campaign 
of terror against his family, a 
man takes the law into his own 
hands. (Rated R) (88 mins.) 
o THE midnight special 

2:00 
©MOVIE -(SUSPENSE- 
DRAMA) ** 'The Eyes Have 
It" 1974 Sinead Cusack, 
Dennis Waterman. In a plot to 
kill a visiting statesman, a trio 
of political assassins takes 
over a school for the blind. (90 
mins.} 

2:15 
ffi ROCK CONCERT 

2‘30 
MOVIE -(HORROR) *‘1/2 
"Phantasm" 1979 Horror, 
science fiction and comedy 
come together in this 
ingenious mixture of fright and 
fun. You'll shriek in laughter 
and fear at this eerie and 
impressive movie. (Rated R) 
(89 mins.) 
ONEWS 
QMOVIE -(ADVENTURE) *V2 
"Perilous Voyage" 1969 
Michael Parks, William 
Shatner. A Latin-American 
revolutionary commands a 

ship loaded with arms hoping 
to use them to overthrow the 
government in his country. (2 
hrs.) 

3:00 
QMOVIE -(SUSPENSE) **1/2 
"Lisa" 1962 Stephen Boyd. 
Dolores Hart. Tvhe story of a 
Jewish girl who is smuggled 
out of W.W.II Europe into 
Israel. (2 hrs.) 

3:30 
©MOVIE -(BIOGRAPHICAL) 
”V2 "Evel Knievel" 1971 
George Hamilton, Sue Lyon. 
The biography of the great 
motorcyle stunt driver. (2 hrs.) 

3:45 
(B NEWS 

O news 
5:00 

OODD COUPLE 
530 

O FACE THE MUSIC 


