
Bishop Webb Talks About ...parents and your children 

The Bible says to train 

up a child in the way he 
should go...(Prov. 22:6). 
A child is blindly loving, 
honest, readily forgiving 
and very easily lead. 
Jesus said that if we want 
to be great, we must hum- 

ble ourselves as a child 
(Mat. 18:1-4). 

Oh, what a respon- 
sibility we have as paren- 
ts, being entrusted with 

rearing of a child, thereby 
potentially shaping the 
development of humanity. 
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So let us arise to the 

problem and challenge 
the wisdom concerning 
one particular past time of 
our children and en- 

deavoring to remedy the 
situation...the Popsicle 
Vendor. 

Speaking as a spiritual 
leader, we are to have 
concern for the wellbeing 
of all peoples, both young 
and old. Jesus told Peter 
to take care of the little 
lamb as well as the sheep 
(St. John 21:15-16). I have 
noticed that our children 
are given to making pur- 
chases (right off the 

street) from the Popsicle 
vendor, who may be near 

the school area. I feel the 

time has come when we, 
as parents, should cease 

to allow anyone to peddle 
to our children, because it 
is dangerous. 

At times, 15-20 
children or more may be 

gathered about the ven- 

dor’s mobile. Some are 

running and others are 

hollering. This tends to 
create quite an at- 

mosphere of disorder and 
confusion, all of which in- 
creases the threat of un- 

expectedly beinc^ hit by a 

passing car. Besides the 
threat of injury, there also 
exists the risk of making a 

purchase from an un- 

verified source. Still to be 
reckoned with is the 
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economical exchange 
merited by the nutritional 
value gained. 

Let us raise the con- 

sciousness of our 

children to all factors and 
likewise instill a proper 
appreciation for the value 
of money. Perhaps taking 
them to the Credit Union 
and opening a joint 
savings account may 
prove to be one useful 
means of training our 

children to save their pen- 
nies and dimes. Most 

assuredly on tomorrow 

they will be greater men 

and women for our having 

Seniors 

Any senior citizens 
holding a Gold Card from 
the CCSD is entitled to 
receive the Antenna, TV- 
10’s monthly program 
guide for a full year for 

only $15. To order, call 
Joan at 737-1010. 
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done so. 

OUTREACH PROGRAM 
Every Wednesday, at 12 

noon — 2 p.m., Pen- 
tecostal Temple, 1117 
North F. Street, will be 

rendering a free meal to 

anybody in need. The 
menu includes beans or 

rice with meat (chicken, 
meat loaf, ham) and pun- 
ch, or coffee, if preferred- 
Other choices are green 
salad and any additional 
cooked or uncooked foods 
donated. 

All prayer and volunteer 
assistance, such as spon- 
soring a meal oc- 

casionally (only a group of 
3-4 needed), or financial 
contribution will be ap- 
preciated. 
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Equal 
Rights 

The Nevada Equal 
Rights Commission is a 

State agency standing by 
to provide cost-free ser- 

vice to the citizens of 
Nevada if you feel that you 
have been discriminated 
against in the above areas 

because of: Race, 
Religion (Creed), Color, 
National Origin (An- 
cestry), Age (no limit), 
Sex & Physical or Visual 

Handicap. 
That’s the NEVADA 

EQUAL RIGHTS COM- 
MISSION!!! 

For more information 
call 386-5304, 1515 E. 

Tropicana Ave., Suite 590 
(between Eastern & 

Maryland). 
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