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God Bless Our 
Sunday School 

God bless our Sunday 
School. Now, we know 
that the Sunday School 
belongs to God like 
everything else. But, you 
know, what belongs to 
God also belongs to us. 
That is why we call it our 

Sunday School. 
Sometimes we call it 
school on Sunday. It is a 
school that you can never 

graduate from and get a 

diploma. You can stay in 
Sunday School until God 
calls you home. It is the 
only department that 
covers the church in its 
entirety and that both 
male and female share 
equally in the task of 
labor. 

Whenever children are 

involved, the interest and 

responsibility of that 
church or nation becomes 
greater, because we 

represent the department 
that deals with the 
development of minds. So 
then, we, as teachers 
must teach the Gospel of 
Jesus Christ to its fullest. 

God wants his people to 
have the wisdom and 
knowledge of God. We 
must attend Sunday 
School. We must attend 
Sunday School. We must 
study the word of God, 
that we will know what 
God is talking about. 

I urge that every Saint 
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from the young to the old 
come on out on Sunday. 
Get into the Sunday 
School. It is wonderful; it 
is beautiful. Come on, 
Brother Preachers. Be the 
lead-off persons. En- 
courage your members. 
Get them to be Sunday 
School — minded. 

We, the Superin- 
tendents and teachers, 
are doing our best, but we 

need all the help we can 

get. God is calling for an 

outstanding Sunday 
School. 

Can God count on your 
Sunday School to be the 
best? 

May God Bless You. 

Deacon O.N. Hampton 

...ask yourself, am I one? 
By Rev. Charles Wyatt 

DIABOLOS (Greek 
Word), an accuser, is 
used 34 times as a title of 
Satan, “The Devil” (The 
English word is derived 
from the Greek)once ol 
Judas, John 6:70, who in 
his opposition to God, ac- 
ted the part of the Devil. 
Apart from John 6:70, 
men are never spoken of 
as Devils. 

It is always to be 

distinguished from 
Daimon, a Demon. It is 
found three times: I Tim. 
3:11; II Tim. 3:3 and Tit. 
2:3, of false accusers, 
slanderers. 

THINK: Diabolos; an 

accuser, who led men to 
arrest Jesus and the men 

put Jesus in prison. Then 
men led Jesus out to 
death after more men had 
been called as accusers 
in a mock trial. 

THINK harder: With 120 
true believers, Christ was 

without sin. But in the 
eyes of all other people, 
Christ Jesus was only a 

political criminal, whom 

they accused of law 

breaking. The accusers 

all must have thought the 
laws of men more im- 

portant than the laws of 
God, the Father of all 

living. 
The accusers were in 

opposition to God and His 
laws, but they may not 
have realized it, as God 
had already known, until 
after the death of Jesus. 

THINK: Jesus died on 
the cross, but he said 
that before this in John 
19:11, “Thou couldst 
have no power at all 
against me, except it 
were^ given thee from 
above. Therefore, he that 
delivered me unto thee 
hath the greater sin.” Did 
he mean his accusers? 
Was Judas the only 
(Diabolos) accuser? 

Who are you? Do you 
serve God by accusing 
your fellow mankind 
brethren? 

Jesus died on the 
cross, but God the Father 
arose Christ from the 
tomb on the 3rd day. His 
accusers thought the 
tomb would be his prison 
of death, but God proved 
this was in opposition of 
His will. 

THINK hard: Diabolos 
the accuser, Judas, went 
to death, not to life, but 
Christ Jesus was not left 
in death to rot. Jesus was 
not an accuser causing 

men to be put in prison or 
to death! 

Are you a Christ-like 
Christian, or are you a 

modern day Pharisee, or 

seducer, or a Judas or a 

legalist? Only you and 
God know! 

Brethren, let us all pray 
that the will of God be 
done as Joel 2:32, Acts 
2:21 and Romans 10:13 
show the will of God is! 

Remember, 
brethren, that after the 

day of Pentecost, began a 

new convenant with God. 
THINK carefully: Joel 

2:27-32: Was it quoted by 
Peter on the day of Pen- 
tecost (Acts 2:16-21)? I 

find it to be amazing 
grace, for God is pouring 
out His spirit on all flesh 
yet today! 

Is God a liar? I accuse 
no person or God, who 
gave His Holy Spirit to all 
flesh worthy of prison or 
death. Do you accuse as 
Diabolos? 

Fear God, who gave 
you his Holy Spirit, which 
is your breath of life 
today. For some 1900 and 
more years God has given 
mankind this grace to 
stop accusing and LOVE! 

Who accused you of 
not having the Holy 
Spirit? Was it Diabolos 
(Satan in spirit)? It must 
be, for Christ would not. 

One nation under God; 
yet, who accused you of 
not? Yes, I say “not” — 

having God in whom we 
live and breathe. 

I would not have you 
ignorant, for in Jean, 
Nevada Prison is a man 

who, similar to Paul on 
the Road to Damascus 
(Acts 9:3), stood under 
the light that shown down 
around him as it did also 

(See Reverend, page 23) 
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