
DIANA ROSS 
IS 

THE BOSS 1)1 \N A 

DIANA ROSS — Ab- 
solutely the Boss! Diana 
recently closed at 
Caesars Palace Maximus 
Room after a one week 
engagement. However, 
she will be returning later 
this summer. If you 
missed her this time, be 
sure to see her when she 
returns for she is truly 
electrifying. 

She relates to everyone 
and totally captivates her 
audience. Diana sings 
with a song in her heart 
for all: The show as a 

fruitful, entertaining ex- 

perience. 

During the Las Vegas 
Full Moon while Diana 
was performing at 
Caesars, a television net- 
work recently showed her 
film, for which she was a 
nominee for an Academy 
Award, “Lady Sings The 
Blues.” 

There is nothing like 
the real thing, and seeing 
Ms. Ross in person really 
makes you appreciate 
this beautiful versatiles 
lady. Diana gets an “A” 
rating from me for she 
truly is THE BOSS STAR 
of the entertainment 
world. Diana, keep 
reaching out for you 
definitely touch 
everyone’s heart as the 
theme of your show is 
“Reach Out And Touch.” 

'The other 
side of. 

Vegas' j 
by Bernie Vegas 

The Temptations gave 
the Ross show that Supei 
Motown sound like the 
old days at the Regal anc 
Tivoli Theatres ir 
Chicago. 

PEOPLE’.\S CHOICE: 
“Drink, Dine and Dan- 
ce,’’ located in the D & K 
Plaza on Owens across 
from the Golden West 
Shopping Center. One of 
the few places where you 
can find hot grits and 
Southern Fried Chicken 

24 hours a day. SARA 
ANN and JOE extend 
their warm invitation to 
everyone. 

BREWERY: Nice, law- 
abiding Disco. Make sure 

you have three IDs, car 
insurance and a VIP card. 
If you have the above you 

are more than welcome. 

PENGUIN CLUB: If 
dominos turn you on, this 
is your spot. Recently 
DEAN CHILDS, 
proprietor, and his ^ister, 
JEAN, celebrated their 
birthday with friends at 
the Club. 

JUBILATION: A touch 
of class, with disco music 
rated as a 5 on a scale of 
1 to 10. 

COLONY CLUB: On 
the corner of Miller and 
Highland you can dig 
“Brothers” in concert 
Thursday through Satur- 
day. 

Sunday, starting at 6 
p.m. check out Willie 
King’s Blues Matinee. 
First 20 unescorted ladies 
are admitted free. 

WELCOME TO NORTH +SLOTS 
LAS VEGAS HOSPITALITY *PINS 

*FUN 
Best Drink* 

in Tam 
THE 

PENGUIN CUS 
1908 loo Vogoo BM. North 

IN NORTH LAS VTGAS 
Ph. 642*9855 

SAM’S TOWN: The 
Westside’s Cleo Jackson 
has turned into a modern- 
day cowboy songster. 
Cleo is right on with the 
right on,s singing Western 
and Rock and Roll. Check 
him out on Boulder High- 
way. Right on Cleo 6-12 
p.m. 

WESTSIDE STORY: 
Located on Owens across 
from the Golden West 
Shopping Center, 
REUBEN BULLOCK’S New 
Supper Club, once a 

dream, now soon to 
become a reality. Watch 
for grand opening 
sometime this summer. 

DUNES HOTEL: 
Marlene Ricci, a lady 
who’s on her way to 
superstardom, appearing 
at the Top of the 
Fabulous Dunes Hotel 
and Country Club. Recent 
addition to her backup 
group is local westside 
'talent, Stephanie 
Lawson. Showtimes Mon- 
day through Saturday, 
midnite to 2 a.m. 

DESERT INN: Kurt 
Stewart’s trio, a hip place 
to take your lady for a 

very mellow listening set 
in the lounge of the 
Desert Inn. Kurt’s reper- 

toire of song and music is 
always pleasing. 

LANDMARK: Pzzzazz — 

who’s got it, or them? 
Monday through Satur- 
day, 8:00, 10:00 and 1:00 
a.m. Their style of music 
complements the artistry 
of Las Vegas’ newest 
star, LORETTA 
HOLLOWAY. 

PSYCHIC TO 
THE STARS... 

Your Business 
IS 

His Business 
LICENSED 

BUSINESS CONSULTANT 

DAVID GUARDINO 

Formtrly Oputtd As 
“JAMIL” 

Can Bewitch, Mesmerize 
Loved Ones, Enemies 

To Do Your Bidding 
ONE OF THE 

WORLD’S FOREMOST 
P8YCHICS 

Advice in Business, 
Love and Personal 

Direction 

DAVID QUARDINO 
HOLIDAY INN DOWNTOWN 

INTERNATIONAL CASINO 
300 N. MAIN ST. SUITE 5Z0 

LAS VE6AS. NV 89101 
TELEPHONE: 
(702) 878-3000 

II No Answer, Phono: 
(702) 385-1500 

Ext 518, 820 or 822 

LAS VEGAS' BEST REVUE" 
1980 BEST Of LAS VEOAS ENTERTAINMENT AWARDS 

"The Foot-Stomping, 
Pulsating, All-African' 

Musical 

Don Hughes productions 
presents Bertha Egnos' 

MOW IM ITS 
10th RECORD 

BREAKING || 
MONTH II 

TWO COCKTAIL 
SHOWS NIGHTLY 

9 PM — $ 15°° 
MIDNIGHT-M250 

RESERVATIONS 737-1766 

HOTEL £L CASINO A MAJOO HCXDLE ENTtF^^WISE 


