
BLACK BIO-CHEMIST RESEARCH 
PROVIDES HOPE FOR CANCER CONTROL 

NOGALES, ARIZONA — A leading black A- 
merican cancer researcher has shown for the 
first time that a human substance can prevent 
human cancer cells from producing tumors in 

experimental animals. This work may have 

great value as a tool in cancer control. 
Edgar E. Smith, Ph. D., described his work 

to 55 eminent scientists, including four Nobel 
prize winners, and 65 of the nation’s leading 
medical writers at the American Cancer So- 

ciety’s 15th Science Writers’ Seminar in 

Nogales, Arizona. Dr. Smith is Associate Pro- 
fessor of Biochemistry and Surgery at Boston 

University School of Medicine. 
The compound is called cyclic AMP, because 

of its chemical structure. Its role as a re- 

gulator in a wide variety of reactions in the 
human body was first discovered in 1956 by 
Nobelist Dr. Earl W. Sutherland, who chaired 
the panel when Dr. Smith spoke. 

Biochemist Smith described how human cancer 

cells injected into the cheek pouches of hamsters 

produced tumors. When another group of the 
animals were injected by human cancer cells 
treated with the compound "their ability to 

form solid tumors was lost.’’ Cyclic AMP is 
a naturally occuring compound in human cells. 

One problem that must be solved before his 
work can be used in cancer control, Dr. Smith 
said, ’’is to find out the specific mechanism in 
the action of cyclic AMP on the unrestrained 
growth characteristic of the cancer cells.’’ 

Also present and discussing the compound 
and another similar substance, cyclicGMP was 

Nelson D. Goldberg, Ph. D., Professor of 
Pahrmacology at the University of Minnesota 
School of Medicine. Dr. Goldberg said he be- 
lieved the two compounds worked together in 
what he called a "Yin Yang’’ principle. 

This idea represents the turning on and off 
of cell growth. Just how they worked together 
is not known. It was inspired he said by the 
ancient Far Eastern concept that "all pro- 

cesses in the human body were controlled by 
two influences which opposed each other.” 

The resolution of this bio-chemical problem 
Dr. Smith agreed was in line with his search 
for the elusive mechanics of the regulator 
compounds. 

Dr. Smith said he believed his work repre- 
sented the first time that cyclic AMP has been 
shown to have the power to suppress the ability 
of human cancer cells to cause tumors. “To 
my knowledge previous experiments with this 

compound’s ability to suppress tumor growth 
was done with animal cancer cells.” 

READY FOR COLLEGE 

These three Las Vegas High School students 
are preparing to attend college this fall. L-R 
Lonnie Carter will be attending Walla Walla 
in Washington, Juanita Tyler, Morgan State in 
Baltimore and Albert Kline at Langston in 
Oklahoma. 
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