
Annual Dinner 
Well Attended 

The Annual Dinner of Las Vegas 
Chamber of Commerce Saturday 

night at the War Memorial building, 
was attended by approximately 200 

members and guests, who enjoyed a 

fine dinner served by the Ladles’ 

Aid of the First Methodist church. 

President O. A. Kimball opened 
the meeting and introduced A. C. 

Orant as master of ceremonies. 

Mayor Leonard Arnett, in behalf of 

the city, made the address of wel- 

come. 

Charles Horrworth, field director 

of the All-Year Club of Southern 

California, and Don Thomas, mag- 

aging director of the club, both 

made interesting talks on the tour- 

ist industry, and gave many strik- 

ing illustrations of its growth and 

value to the entire southwest. Mr. 

Thomas expressed the belief that 
reasonable prices for accommoda- 
tions and the absence of price boost- 

ing on special occasions is responsi- 
ble for much of the advantage this 

region enjoys in the matter of tour- 

ist travel. 
R. G. Knickerbocker, engineer la 

charge of the eectro-metallurgicil 
laboratory of the government at 

Bouder City, gave a most interest- 

ing and instructive address. 

“You need have no fear of lack 
of ore bodies in this region" Mr. 

Knickerbocker said. “Our problem 
is to choose the ones for experi- 
mental purposes which will best 

lend themselves to profitable treat- 
ment by Boulder Dam power. You 

have plenty of them within the 200- 

mtle radius* which the dam will 

serve. 

“The great bulk of metals are 

produced by electrolosis. The elec- 
tro-thermal processes are under ex- 

perimentation. Our installation at 

the government plant is nearly com- 

pleted. The cost of operating the 

largest of our electric furnaces will 
Mbe about $50 per day." 

The experimental plant of which 

Mr. Knickerbocker is in charge was 

secured through the efforts of Con- 

gressman Scrugham. 

Hon. P. A. McCarran, Nevada’s 

junior senato, made the principal 
address of the evening. It was elo- 

quent and full of fine patriotic fer- 

vor. 

The senator began his address by 
recounting some of his experiences 
on his first visit to the embryo town 

of Las Vegas in 1905., He called at- 

tention to the pitiful condition in 
which the nations of Europe find 
themselves and called upon the peo- 

ple of America to stand fast in sup- 

port of American institutions to 

which the nations of the world are 

looking for leadership. 

The dinner was preceded bv y 

parade in which the street equip- 
ment and fire department of the 

City of Las Vegas occupied an im- 

portant place. Floats were entered 
by the service clubs and by several 
business organizations. A brilliant 
illumination feature was provided 
by two powerful searchlights on a 

truck which were brought here from 
Los Angeles. 

Following the dinner, colored mo- 

tion pictures of the Lake Mead- 
Boulder Dam area were shown, after 

which the general public enjoyed a 

dance. Las Vegas high school or- 

chestra provided excellent music. 

McNamee Gives 
Easter Program 

At the regular meeting of Las 

Vegas Rotary Club Thursday noon, 
Leo McNamee sponsored the pro- 

gram of the day by Introducing ills 
guests, Rev. Father Hamilton, from 
the Monestray near Serre Madre, 
Calif., and Rev. Father Lamb, of the 
Church of Joan of Arc, in Las Vegas. 

Father Hamilton gave the prin- 
cipal address speaking on Holy 
Week. 

“The rising from the dead is the 
supreme proof of the divinity of 
Christ,” he said, and concluded by 
saying, “Christianity is the only 
power which can stem the tide of 
red radicalism which is sweeping 
the countries of Europe today.” The 
entire address was full of religious 
feeling and was listened to with 
close atention. 

Mr. Anderson, representing the U. 
S. Forest Service in this section, told 
of plans of the bureau for establish- 
ing winter sports facilities in the 
Charleston mountain area. He stat- 
ed that the policy of the service is 
to provide for the greatest good for 
the greatest number in the recrea- 
tional areas. 

Harry Gilbert, accompanied by 
Miss Paulus, gave a beautiful violin 
number, “The Adoration,” which was 

received with hearty applause. The 
young violinist is. a favorite with 
Rotarians, who have several times 
had the opportunity to hear hi» 
music. 

Bill Ferron, Dave Davis and Wal- 
ter Bond were appointed the com- 

mittee to stage an “April Fool” pro- 
gram for next Thursday’s meeting. 
That date will also be celebrated as 
the fourteenth anniversary of the 
formation of the Las Vegas Rotary 
Club. 

EL PORTAL THEATRE 
ASSISTS BOY scours 

El Portal Theatre was packed to 

capacity Wednesday afternoon and 
evening- when, in addition to an ex- 

cellent screen program, the boys’ 
band, sponsored by the Glendale, 
Cal., Kiwanis Club, gave concerts. 

Thriuogh the courtesy of, Cragin 
& Pike, the proceeds of the con- 

certs, amounting to a substantial 
sum, were turned over to the Boy 
Scouts organization for the purpose 
of helping defray the expenses of a 

representative of each of the four 
boy scout troops in Las Vegas to 
the National Jamboree at Washing- 
ton, D. C., next summer. 

THE McCARTHYS ARE 
GOING TO MANILA 

Ms. Charles McCarthy and daugh- 
ters, Mrs. W. B. Means and M’ss 

Betty McCarthy of Fort Douglas, 
Utah, arrived in Las Vegas Tuesday 
for a short visit with old friends. 
They left Friday morning for San 
Francisco, where they will join 
Lieut.-Col. McCarthy. On the ninth 
of April the family, with the excep- 
tion of Mrs. Means, will embark on 
the transport Grant for Manila, 
where Col. McCarthy will be station- 
ed. They are anticipating a delight- 
ful trip of a month, stopping at 
Honolulu and the island of Guam. 
The post w'here they are to make 
their hom^ is in the mountains not 
far from Manila. Mrs. Means and 
her husband, Captain Means, expect 
to be transferred to Honolulu in 
June. 

Quality Bakery 
Gave Fine Cake 

The Quality Bakery was the vol- 

untary contributor of a three-deck- 
er, beautifully decorated and prop- 
erly inscribed “birthday cake/*’ in 

honor of the 26th anniversary of the 

incorporation of the city for the 
dinner at the War Memorial audi- 
torium last Saturday night. 

The creation was a work of art as 

well as a very toothsome addition 
to the repast as testified by that 

portion of the crowd fortunate 

enough to get a morsel of it. 

SALT LAKE TRIDUNE 
NOTICES ANNUAL DINNER 

The Salt Lake Tribune of Monday 
last showed a friendly interest in Las 
Vegas and the Boulder Dam area, by 
publishing a summary of the pro- 

cedings at the annual dinner of Las 
Vegas Chamber of Commerce, In- 
cluding a report of the speech of 
Senator P. A. McCarran. 

The enterprise and sympathetic 
cooperation of The Tribune was ap- 
preciated by the business men of 
Las Vegas. 

MRS. SHEAHAN UNDERGOES 
OPERATION AT HOSPITAL 

Mrs. Timothy Sheahan underwent 
an operation at Las Vegas hospital 
this forenoon. According to latest 
reports s^he is progressing satis- 
factorily. 

LOOK! 
How would you like to get 

a high grade Radio or Ro- 
tary Clock Free?. ABSO- 
LUTELY FREE! 

We mean what we say. 
Just a few minutes of your 
time is all that is needed. 

Write for Details. 

N. D. MERCHANDISE 

2730 Cincinnati Street 
Los Angeles, California 

TIRES and TUBES 
New, Used, Rebuilt 

Wheels and Rims to Fit 
Moat All Cars 

ED. BAGGETT’S PLACE 
Three Miles Out of Las Vegas 

on Salt Lake Highway tf 

WOMEN Earn Good Pay address and 
mail envelopes for us. Everything 
Supplied including stamps. Write, 
enclosing stamped addressed envel- 

ope. Nationwide Distributors, 401 

Broadway, N. Y. 

Dr. and Mrs. E. Winters have re 

turned from a visit to southern Cali 
fornia. 
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