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Report Given 
Rotary Club 

_♦ 

Marion Earl presided at the meet- 

ing of Las Vegas Rotary club 

Thursday for the first time since 
he was made president of the club. 

The meeting was devoted to a 

most interesting report on the re- 

cert convention of Rotary Inter- 
national at Detroit, at which 7,500 
delegates were present from 43 
countries. 

The city of Detroit and its auto- 

mobile industries did much to make 

the stay of the visitors pleasant 
among other things keeping 750 new 

automobiles with drivers at the 
service of delegates at all times. 

Speaking of automobiles, Presi- 
dent Earl said that he decided to 

buy a new Ford sedan ar.d spoke to 

a dealer about it. The dealer said, 
“Would you like to see your car 

made?” So he was taken to the as- 

sembling plant and followed the as- 

sembling of his car beginning with 
the bare frame, through all the pro- 
cesses of the long line, and at the 

end of the line got in his “new car” 
and drove away. 

According to the report, the only 
unpleasant incident of the great 
convention was the address of Post- 

master General Farley which was 

described as a partisan political ad- 

dress, devoid of tact and offensive 
to members of the large foreign 
delegation. 

RIVER FLOW DIMINISHING 

The water shortage in the Colo- 
ra river is becoming serious, it was 

revealed today by a report from the 
bureau of reclamation, which re- 

vealed that the river had dropped 
another 50 feet. 

At Bright Angel, the report show- 
ed 2,400 cubic feet per second flow- 

ing down the river and within 24 
hours there was but 2,350 cubic fee. 
This is compared to normal, for this 
season of the year of20,00 cubic feet. 

McClellan death is 
SAID TO BE NATURAL 

The coroner’s jury which investi- 
gated the circumstances of the 
death of Clifford CcClellan found 
that McClellan died as a result of 
natural causes, “deceased having 
passed away in bed in his apart- 
ment in a local rooming house.” 

Dr. Roy W. Martin, after examina- 
tion of the body, found that there* 
was no evidence of foul play. 

Funeral services for McClellan 
were held at the grave in Wood- 
lawn cemetery at 5 o'clock Wednes- 
day afternoon. 
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Goes Quintuplets Six Better 

Queenie, a 2-year-old collie belonging to Mrs. Lillian Compton of Los 
Aftgeles, is mighty proud of her record-breaking family of 11 pups. 
Queenie, pictured with her mistress and part of her family, has ac- 

commodations for only nine at meaJ times, so extra rations are served 

41 File for Office 
With County Clerk 

In order that our readers may 

take a bird’s eye view or goose 
pimple squint as the case may be, 
at the list of those local candidates 
for whom they are to be asked to 

cast their votes at the primary 
election, we present below a list 
of all the filings to date in the 

office of the County Clerk: 
District Attorney: Guy E Bakfr, 

republican and Roger Foley, demo- 
crat. 

County Clerk: Herbert H. Krause, 
republican, Lloyd S. Payne, demo- 
crat, and Lydia T. Buzik, republican, 
W. D. Schuyler, democrat. 

County Recorder and Auditor: 
David Farnsworth, republican, and 
Ernest L. Ward, democrat. 

County Treasurer: W. B. Mundy, 
democrat. 

Sheriff: Fred Jensen, democrat: 
Wm. J. “Bill” Wallace, democrat: 
Joe May, democrat. 

Justice of the Peace: Las Vegas 
Township—Ernest G. Adams, Marion 
B. $&rl, John L. Russell, Overton 
Township—Geo. E. Perkins: Mes- 
quite Township—W. ID. Abbott: 
Bunkerville Township — Warren 
Hardy. 

Constable: Las Vegas Township— 
Reese Morgan, republican > B. L. 
(Blackie) Hollis, demoorat: J, F. 

(Continued on Page 16) 

Varied Program 
At C. C. Meeting 

Sam Lawson, vice-president, occu- 

pied the chair at the meeting of the 
Las Vegas Chamber of Commerce 

Tuesday. Miss Maude Frazier pre- 
sented Ethel Corey as her guest. 

Bob Griffith asked that suggest- 
tions be made as to a name for the 
Boulder dam reservoir, already 
named by the Department of the 

Interior, "Lake Mead." 
Bob Russell, reporting for the 

publicity committee, read from arti- 
cles by Lee Shipley in Los Angeles 
Times. 

James Cashman reported progress 
in the campaign to bring about im- 

provement of Stewart street. 
James Farnsdale requested the co- 

operation of the chamber in a two- 

day celebration of Labor Day. 

Secretary Nye Wilson, report’ng 
upon the Motor Vehicle Conference 
recently held in Salt Lake City 
He expressed the belief that because 
of the donation of such conferences 

by special interests, no good could 
come out of them. „ 

Dr. Newman discussed means 

whereby the Chamber may secure 

desired legislation by the coming 
legislature.. 

Lincoln and 
Clark C, of C. 

Holds Meeting 
A delegation of the leading mem- 

bers of the Lincoln county Chamber 
of Commerce arrived In Las Vegas 
Thursday for a conference with the 
Las Vegas Chamber of Commerce 

regarding the possibility of securing 
power form Boulder Dam and to de- 
vise plans for financing a power 

'jr^ansmission lftve ifrom the dam 

power house to the Pioche district, 
or the Ely district if that section 
desires to secure power. 

The meeting was held at the 
Apache Hotel, several members of 

the Las Vegas chamber being pres- 
ent. The meeting was called to or- 

der by President Archie Grant of 

the Las Vegas chamber, who, after* 
welcoming the visiting delegation, 
turned the proceedings over to Mr. 
J. H. Buehler, of Pioche, as chair- 
man. 

The Lincoln county men in pre- 

senting their case, called attention 
to thefact, not yet generally rec- 

alled, that the Pioche district has 
already in sight or partially devel- 

oped the greatest tonnage of ore of 

any district in America, mostly 
(Continued on Page 16) 

Dam Vacation Is 
Set for Labor Day 
The Labor Day celebration com- 

mittee of the Las Vegas Carpenter’s 
Union announced that a two day 
vacation would be given all work- 
men on Boulder Dam by Six Com- 

panies, on September 2nd and 3rd. 
The Labor Day vacation is one of 
the few yearly shut downs on the 

’great project. 
Anderson Bros, have expressed a 

wilingness to help make this year’s 
fete a big succes. 

The Boulder City Central Labor 
Council is taking care of the ar- 

rangements for the Boulder section 
of the program. 

James Farnsdale has been named 
chairman of the joint committee. An 
invitation is extended to merchants 
and business houses of Las Vegas 
and Boulder City to enter floats in 
the Labor Day parade to be held in 
Las Vegas. 

Murphy Heads 
Union No. 165 

J. J. Murphy was elected Presi- 
dent of Las Vegas Local No. 1SS, 
of the Bartender’s International at 

the regular meeting held Monday 
■night at the V. F. 'W. hall. Harry 
Ball will fill Murphy’s former post 
of viae-iyesldent. 


