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Student Senate news

Math and science reps
voted out by Senate

by Karen Splawn

The Senate voted 11-- 0

Oct. 17 to override a provi-

sion that woul d have let Sen.

John Epperson (math and
science) keep his seat.

Epperson had missed
three senate meetings with-

out informing Student Gov-

ernment.
Three unexcused ab-

sences on the part of a
senator, according to the
Student Government Con-

stitution, is cause for dis-

qualification.
"It's rare for senators

not to give their peers an-

other chance, but Epperson
made no attempt to contact
Student Government," said
Senate President Mike
Kennedy. " I don't think any
of the senators wanted to

throw anyone off, but there
are rules and regulations."

Sen. Bud Benneman
(business and economics)
pointed out he had left mes-

sage after message for
Epperson.

"If somebody cares
about the Senate, they're
gonna show up," Benneman
said. "We didn't know ifwe'd
even make quorum this time
or not."

Only 11 senators were
in attendance.

Epperson could not be
reached for comment.

Although it was not
Halloween, senators had a
prank pulled on them when
a bogus item proposing that
a student fill the business
manager's position was put
on the agenda.

The business manager

handles all Student Government--

affiliated budgets.
Many senators debated

the plan until they discov-

ered the proposal was phony.
Sen. Scott Fisher (busi-

ness and economics) said the
agendaitem wasusedto"see
if anyone was paying atten-
tion to what they were vot-

ing on."
"You really had me go-

ing there," said Vice Presi-

dent Kevin Briggs on the
pseudo initiative.

Sen. Maxi Maultsby
(engineering) was approved
10-- 0 (he abstained from vot-

ing) as assistant director of
Entertainment and Pro-

gramming. He will earn a
monthly stipend of $250.

see SENATE page 3

LAW SCHOOL
from page 1

program, we feel that there
are those persons who will
be attracted to the idea of
pioneering a quality school
of law in Nevada," Flagg
said.

The annual operating
expenses, not including the
construction of a building
and a law library, are esti-

mated to cost between $5
and $6 million. The UNLV
Foundation is looking to lo-

cal community members to
help fund the law school.

"Las Vegas lawyers
have expressed their inter-
est in a Nevada law school
as a center for continuing
legal studies, intellectual
stimulation and support,"
Flagg said. The law school
will concentrate on gaming,
entertainment and natural
resources.

"The University is
committed to pursuing a law
school. It may become a
reality as soon as 1995,"
Flagg said.
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Sen. Mike Bunin
suggested

the Thursday Student Gov-

ernment that a new
Board director be

found, after he the
of current di-

rector Kim
a board

called her a "poor"
"who takes her

power a new level."
was not at

the Senate meeting.
Bunin cited

of where
Oct. 3 after she

asked him and board mem-

ber Lee
errand for her.

a telephone inter-
view, said Bunin
and Lee volunteered to get

her that

"As long as I have
members), I can

start meeting,"
said. "They did one

that
Bunin nor Lee

with ballots
from fall

"It's easy for them
say I didn't my job right,
but part of their job
board show
for ballot counting," she said.

Many candidates who
were at the Oct. 3

felt the argument
and was

according
Sen. Bud Benneman

and economics).
Benneman said Bunin

probably disagreed with the

board's the
fines of candidates cited for
illegal of flyers.

The fines,
said, were waived

over
candidates were guilty and
the of

flyers by
Bunin also

Kershaw's handling ofa case
involving 199 1

Queen Jay Jay Held.
Kershaw, who

the same as Held,
broke a tie by voting fine

for
feet of a voting booth.

Bunin said that when
he why she voted

Held, re-

plied she didn't "want take

page 3
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there were 43,826
seats available for first-yea- r

law compared to
42,296 places for those

of 3.5 percent. the
number of applicants for
those seats has
percent in the same

These
with the new LSAT
exam's new have

over
the entrance exam. The

Ronkin Educational Group
has noted a marked increase
in the number of students

services
to help prepare for LSAT.

One reason the Law
School Admissions Council
has the test that

many test takers were
top scores. The revi-

sions were aimed in part at
eliminating over-crowdin- g

at the high end of the scale.
The new scale allows for

among
are nervous that the new
test is going more

and they are more
consciousof to

prepare.
Law school applicants

appear to understand that
the has

and have
their application strategies
accordingly. are
applying to more schools

than they did in the In
are

to a larger number of
schools."

been for law whose
LSAT mean scores were 31-3- 3

(on the old scale of 10-48- ).

These schools 326.2
percent more applications
than last year, compared to
an increase of only 3.6 per-

cent for schools with test
means of 40 or

Although the
trend is toward applying to
safety there are also
the who would
rather work harder to gain
entrance to a more competi-
tive school. The

a job after gradua-
tion will be even more diff-
icult than into law
school and a from a
top school will help the stu-
dent to the best job.
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Senator calls for new
elections director

Splawn
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Fall Extended Hours
Reference Guide

fifflCfi Extended evening m Lprflffofl

Student Development Tuesday 5--7 p.m. Library

Financial Services Tuesday 5--7 p.m. Humanities Bldg.

Admissions Tuesday 7 p.m. Frazier Hall

Cashiers Tuesday 7 p.m. Frazier Hall

Student Support Tuesday 7 p.m. Humanities Bldg.

Vice President for

Student Services Office Tuesday 7 p.m. Humanities Bldg.

Registrar's Office Tuesday 7 p.m. Frazier Hall
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