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Homecoming on the wav
oy mary whalen

staff writer

In order to make this
one of the best Homecom-
ing events ever, CSUN
has named a special
Homecoming Committee
in an effort to optimize
communication between
ail parties involved in plan-
ning the event.

The UNLV Homecom-
ing Committee will be
chaired by the Dean of
Student Services, Dr.
Robert Ackerman.

Members include
representatives from
CSUN, the Alumni-Association-

,

and the
Athletic Department.

"Trie object is to get
some communication go-
ing between us aU," said
Jimenez,
Entertainment and Pro-

gramming. "We've
already met about four
times last summer and
once early this semester
and we've come up with a
pretty good idea of what
we want," he said.

Homecoming will be
held November 4-- 7.

Various activities will be
scheduled throughout the
week which will include
entertainment, bands,
food and beverage (sold at
cost), contests, tour-
naments and pep rallies.

The program will con-
clude with a float parade
around the Silver Bowl
prior to this year's game
against Long Beach State.
Homecoming queen
finalists will be escorted
around the stadium in
classic convertibles and
election results will hp an.
nounced at halftime.

A tailgate
party will be held before
the game in the Silver
Bowl parking lot at 4pm.
The pre-gam- e pep rally
will be held on Friday,
November 6, at 12:30pm
in the MSU courtyard.

When homecoming was
first held during football
season, it was celebrated
on the football field of Las
Vegas High School.

"The difference in

Homecoming this year is

the organization," Jime-

nez said. "There's no

reason why more people

within CSUN cannot get
involved in this event, for
example, intramurals will
be involved this year and
will have their own spon-
sored events."

Jimenez, who also hel-

ped organize the recent
Oktoberfest celebration,
said that event also enabl-
ed CSUN to raise suffi-
cient funds to help make
Homecoming a success.
"It is unfortunate to have
violence at any event, but
Oktoberfest was a highly
successful, synergistic
event for the students andl
overall, people were II

satisfied and things were
positive," he said. 'i

"So far, we've gene- - L
rated about $5,000 from
CSUN sponsored
events this year. That,
plus the $15,000 In our
entertainment budget
should help make home- - ;

coming really memor- -

able," he said. "We're
really working together
with everyone else this
year to make this happen
and to encourage unity. I

think it will be a great
event."
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HEEEE'S BACK Armon "The Hammer" Gilliam returns to the Shark Tank

in a new uniform for the exhibition game against the Chicago Bulls. J(

photo by jon ansoklRebel photo editor I

Gore Sr. talks about son
by roy theiss

staff writer

Former Tennessee
Senato Albert Gore Sr.,
79, is back on the cam-

paign trail, this time pro-

moting his son's bid for

the Democratic president-

ial nomination.
Speaking at a reception

sponsored by the UNLV

Young Democrats, Satur-

day, the former senator
said "he was ready to
jump for halleujah" when
his son, Albert Gore Jr.,
told him he was going to

, run for president. V

Gore told the full house
in the MSU fireside lounge

that politics and cam-

paigning have changed a
great deal since he en-

tered Congress in 1939.
"When I started out, a

senator needed $50,000
to campaign, now he
needs $5 million," he said.

Then he turned political.

"Now more than any

time in history, America

needs a Democrat," he

said, a comment that trig-

gered a standing ovation.
Gore said his son tho-

ught that selling 400 TOW

missiles to the Ayatollah
was a "stupid and horrible

.thing?'-;- Because'-- , of.
'" Watergate'iahd' Vietnam,'

his son'lost'.interest.in

politics, Gore said.
Gore Jr. entered divini- -

ty school "to get some
answers to troublesome
questions because of the
destruction of life he saw
in Vietnam, Gore Sr. said,

but after a year of divinity

school, Gore Jr. became
an investigative reporter

for the Tennessean, un-

covering political corrup-

tion in Nashville he got

back into politics to effect

change. Gore Jr. was el-

ected to the House of

Representatives in 1976
and to the Senate in 1984.

Gore ' Jr. opposes ,a
' nuclear dump site in

Nevada, Gore Sr. said.

Fhefto sirikG GludGiit eowlcos :

by rob hill

staff writer

The Office of Student
Services was broken into

for the second time in six

months, according to

Dean of Ctudcrrt Services,
Robert Ackcrmsn.
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he could not be sure if this
break-i- n was related to the

rash of break-in- s which
took place in April, but ho

did say it was possible.
"Coin times it happen-

ed, they knew whero they
v.cr-f-e:.-
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leave some evidence j

behind. However, ha
would not comment on the
nature of the evidence,

According to Heller.- -

bock, the burglars forced I ,

the lock on the ci'.zzs doors l

cftho Tinancisl Aideu'ice ')

to c -- .in zcrszs to the
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